Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 February 2021 2:58 PM

To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE; SUR

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: New Assignment (OD Survey) - GBD261T - DOA ON 02/02/2021 - Oref:
20/21/21/VC05/024199 [External Confidential]

Attachments: GBD261T 2ND IA.pdf; GBD261T SUPP.pdf

Dear Kenny,

Enclosed herewith 2" preliminary advice of GBD 261T.
Repairer able to undertake the repair cost not more than Lump Sum $18,000.00.

Kindly approve on supplementary.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 8 February 2021 5:40 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>; assighnments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: New Assignment (OD Survey) - GBD261T - DOA ON 02/02/2021 - Oref: 20/21/21/VC05/024199
[External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Denise

Please proceed to authorize repairs at lump sum not exceeding S$18k and before excess is
S$600 (section I).

Thank you.

Best Regards

Kenny Lim

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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