
 

       
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19 / 02-22 @ Kaki Bukit Auto Hub, Singapore 417921 

Email: ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com      

 Tel: 67418277 Fax: 67468277  

 GST REG NUMBER: 201635107M 

 
 

Lonpac Insurance Bhd                               29/4/2021 

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 

The Concourse 

Singapore 199555  
     
Attn:   Motor Claims Dept     

LETTER OF DEMAND 

 
Our Ref   : YN5837A    Your Ref     :     - 
Dear Sir, 

VEHICLE  #   : YN5837A 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING : YN5837A & GBD261T ALONG PIE TOWARDS CHANGI BEFORE 

    THOMSON ROAD EXIT ON 2/2/21 

COST OF REPAIR : S$2,950.00 (As agreed) 

COR ADD GST  7% :  S$   206.50 

LOSS OF USE            : S$   980.00  

{4 work days + 2 weekends + 1 day prs} X S$140 

TOWING  : S$80.00 

LTA & GIA SEARCH : S$7.45 

TOTAL   : S$4,223.95 

DOLLARS:  FOUR THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED TWENTY-THREE AND 
CENTS NINETY-FIVE ONLY. 

Please arrange for DV to be signed by us (workshop) because we are authorised by client to sign 
on behalf.   Please see attached Letter of authorisation ( see note 5) .  
 

For your prompt payment. 

Thank you. 

 

Yours faithfully, 

Ryder Auto Pte Ltd 

____ ____ 

Chan San Choon 
Director 
DipEng, AAE MIMI, MSAE(Aust) 

 

mailto:ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com




my� of this Discharge Voucher is only 
for my daim for property damage and not prejudicial 
ID any other daims arising from the same accidont. 



 

       
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2, #02-19 / 02-22 @ Kaki Bukit Auto Hub, Singapore 417921 

Email: ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com      

 Tel: 67418277 Fax: 67468277  

 GST REG NUMBER: 201635107M 

 
 

Lonpac Insurance Bhd                               29/4/2021 

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 

The Concourse 

Singapore 199555  

     

Attn:   Motor Claims Dept       

 

TAX INVOICE 

 

Our Ref   : YN5837A    Your Ref     :     - 

Dear Sir, 

VEHICLE  #   : YN5837A 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING : YN5837A & GBD261T ALONG PIE TOWARDS CHANGI BEFORE 

    THOMSON ROAD EXIT ON 2/2/21 

 

COST OF REPAIR : S$2,950.00 (As agreed) 

 

COR ADD GST  7% :  S$  206.50 

 

TOTAL   : S$3,156.50 

DOLLARS:  THREE THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED FIFTY-SIX AND CENTS 
FIFTY ONLY. 

Please arrange for DV to be signed by us (workshop) because we are authorised by client to sign 
on behalf.   Please see attached Letter of authorisation ( see note 5) .  
 

For your prompt payment. 

Thank you. 

 

Yours faithfully, 

Ryder Auto Pte Ltd 

____ ____ 

Chan San Choon 
Director 
DipEng, AAE MIMI, MSAE(Aust) 

mailto:ryderautoworkshop@gmail.com


Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 02 Feb 2021 / 13:33:41

Receipt Date/Time : 02 Feb 2021 / 13:33:40

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-210202-001743

Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference 
No.

Amount 
Before

GST (S$)

GST 
Amount 

(S$)

Amount 
After GST 

(S$)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - GBD261T
As at 02 Feb 2021/13:00:00
Insurance Co: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

1 Insurance Enquiry - GBD261T
Enquiry Fee 
20210202133314512775

7.00 0.49 7.49

Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49

Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49

Rounding Difference 0.04

Total Amount Payable 7.45

Paid By

ndy5gp8b Credit Card 7.45

Total 7.45

Cash Change 0.00

Tendered Amount 7.45

Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service 
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee 

may apply.
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>
Sent: June 25, 2021 3:59 PM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION: Your Vehicle GBD261T; Our Vehicle YN5837A Accident 

involving YN5837A & GBD261T On 2 Feb2021- LPI Ref: 20/21/21/VC05/024199 
[External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
 
 
Dear Jasper  
 
Please proceed as recommended.  
 
Thank you.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Kenny Lim  
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.  
From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 25 June 2021 1:58 pm 
To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: [WARNING: ATTACHMENT UNSCANNED][WARNING: ATTACHMENT UNSCANNED]PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION: Your 
Vehicle GBD261T; Our Vehicle YN5837A Accident involving YN5837A & GBD261T On 2 Feb2021- LPI Ref: 
20/21/21/VC05/024199 [External Confidential] 
 
Gentle Reminder  
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

Best Regards, 



2

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)  
Sent: June 4, 2021 3:35 PM 
To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Urgent: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION: Your Vehicle GBD261T; Our Vehicle YN5837A Accident involving YN5837A & 
GBD261T On 2 Feb2021- LPI Ref: 20/21/21/VC05/024199 [External Confidential] 
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the subject matter. 
 
It was reported that Insured driver rear-ended TP. 
 
Summary to offer to repairer RYDER AUTO PTE LTD  is as follows: 
 

TP CLAIMED REVISED -TO 
OFFER   

Cost of Repair (w/gst) $         7,381.61   $           3,156.50   
Loss of Use (7 days x 
$140.00)   $            980.00   $              700.00  

(7 days x 
$100.00)  

LTA Search Fee $                7.45   $                  7.45   
Towing Fee $              80.00   $                80.00   
Proposed Total   $         8,449.06   $           3,943.95   

 
Breakdown of days is as follows: 
 

Recommended repair days  4 

Weekends / Downtime  3 

CLAIM DAYS  7 
 
For your approval and/or further instruction please. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

Best Regards, 
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