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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Sent: February 17, 2021 3:33 PM
To: Stars Autoworks
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Accident involving SKW 5548C and SHA 9329T on the 29/01/2021.
Attachments: vlcsnap-2021-02-17-12h15m26s923.png; vlcsnap-2021-02-17-12h15m27s804.png; 

vlcsnap-2021-02-17-12h15m28s477.png; vlcsnap-2021-02-17-12h15m29s113.png; OI 
sketch.JPG

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the matter above. We attached the screenshot extracted from the video footage for your 
reference.              
 
Based on the video footage, our insured taxi should not be liable for this accident. Attached our insured report 
for your references. 
 
We have our principal’s instruction that we are not able to look into the case. 
 
Thanks 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: ANG Richard <richard.angbs@axa.com.sg>
Sent: February 17, 2021 12:19 PM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: filenet-ctom-p-sg
Subject: S1M031RH_RA_TP_RE: Your ref : SHA 9329T_DOA : 29/01/2021
Attachments: vlcsnap-2021-02-17-12h15m26s923.png; vlcsnap-2021-02-17-12h15m27s804.png; 

vlcsnap-2021-02-17-12h15m28s477.png; vlcsnap-2021-02-17-12h15m29s113.png

Hi Jasper, 
 
Insured had video footage but we are not able to upload to you as the video size is big. 
 
We attached the screenshot extracted from the video footage for your reference.              
 

 
 
Based on the video footage, our insured taxi should not be liable for this accident.  
 
Thank you. 
 
Regards 
 

 
 
__________________________________________________ 
Richard Ang  | Specialist, Motor Claims Department 
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 
www.axa.com.sg 
Email: richard.angbs@axa.com.sg  
Customer Care No. 1800 8804888 
 
We remain available to serve you during the circuit breaker period. For AXA’s COVID-19 updates & initiatives, please visit 
https://www.axa.com.sg/covid-19-updates. 
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Please consider the environment before printing this message 
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended 
recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately. 
 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, February 17, 2021 11:17 AM 
To: ANG Richard <richard.angbs@axa.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Your ref : SHA 9329T / DOA : 29/01/2021 
 
Dear Richard, 
 
TP no video footage. 
 
Kindly advise any video footage from insured. If video footage show liability down on TP, TP will consider to withdraw 
claim. 
 
Thanks  
 
Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
-----Disclaimer----- 
This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you 
are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you 
have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented 
in this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd 
or any other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said 
companies.  
-----Disclaimer----- 
This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you 
are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you 
have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented 
in this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd 
or any other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said 
companies.  
This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by  
AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any  
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is  
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify  
the sender immediately. 



4/11/2021 Claim Portal

https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/html/index-vendor-service-requests.html#/service-requests/view-message/?serviceRequestNumber=20… 1/1

Type

 Question

Message

HI, yr ref is CC4/ASM21001574/Kba3. Please let us have your tax invoice for the services rendered, if

applicable. TY.

Reply

TP's claim

Menu LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) 
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