Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your acceptance.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Wednesday, 14 April 2021 4:23 PM

'‘AIM PTE LTD'

Admin A

RE: NOA- GBJ2365H // TP Claim 29.01.2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/11121001480/Upa3
DV_GBJ2365H.pdf

We confirm settlement at a global sum of $6,600.00(all-in).

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 April 2021 8:50 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: NOA- GBJ2365H // TP Claim 29.01.2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/11121001480/Upa3

Hi Hsiao Tong,

We accepted the offer, please proceed

Thank you

Regards,
Jacyne



Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd (aim)

Office: 61 Ubi Ave 2 #07-04 Automobile Megamart Singapore 408898

W/S: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Kaki Bukit Vicom #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933
Tel: 91198371

On Sun, Apr 11, 2021 at 12:24 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@I|kkauto.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/mdm,
We refer to the above matter.
We propose settlement at a global sum of $6,600.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 25 February 2021 4:13 PM

To: AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: NOA- GBJ2365H // TP Claim 29.01.2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/11121001480/Upa3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 24 Feb 2021.

We will look into the matter and get back to you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 February 2021 9:31 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: NOA- GBJ2365H // TP Claim 29.01.2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/11121001480/Upa3

Hi Hsiao Tong,
Please find attached LOD and repair bill for your necessary action

Thanks and regards
Jacyne

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd (aim)

Office: 61 Ubi Ave 2 #07-04 Automobile Megamart Singapore 408898

W/S: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Kaki Bukit Vicom #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933
Tel: 91198371

On Tue, Feb 2, 2021 at 3:04 PM AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com> wrote:
Hi,

Please find attached as requested.
Thank you

Regards,
Jacyne

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd (aim)

Office: 61 Ubi Ave 2 #07-04 Automobile Megamart Singapore 408898

W/S: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Kaki Bukit Vicom #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933
Tel: 91198371



On Mon, Feb 1, 2021 at 5:54 PM Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please provide us the following.
e evidence i.e. video and scene photo
e PIRresult (if any)
e GIA /police report
o Estimated cost of repair

Our respective case handler, Hsiao Tong will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 1 February 2021 11:38 am

To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim @iii.com.sg>
Subject: NOA- GBJ2365H // TP Claim 29.01.2021

Hi,
Please find attached to advise further.
Thanks

Regards,
Jacyne

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd (aim)

Office: 61 Ubi Ave 2 #07-04 Automobile Megamart Singapore 408898

W/S: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Kaki Bukit Vicom #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933

Tel: 91198371

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers
(located both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry,
including the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing,
handling and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying
with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:
This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.
It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.
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If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing
and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside
and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General
Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with
your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to
the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed. It may contain confidential and/or
legally privileged information. If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has
reached you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby notified that
any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination of this information in any way or in any
manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. Internet communications may not be entirely secure or
accurate as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses. Therefore, we do not
accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this message or any delay in delivery which may arise
as a result of Internet transmission or any modification.



