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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 5 February 2021 4:05 PM
To: banseng_rms@hotmail.com
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK 5135E(AIG) AND SMW 7659D AT/ALONG 22 LOR 7 

TOA PAYOH CARPARK ENTRANCE ON 26/01/2021

05 Feb 2021 
  
M/s BAN SENG ROASTED MEAT SUPPLIER                 [By Email Only] 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
You Ref: GBK5135E 
Our Ref: CC6/AIG21001360/Upa3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK 5135E(AIG) AND SMW 7659D AT/ALONG 22 LOR 7 TOA PAYOH CARPARK ENTRANCE 
ON 26/01/2021 
  
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. to deal with the third-party claim against your policy. 
  
We have received a claim from SMW7659D against your insurance policy. 
 
Based on both parties report and all the available information on hand, we are of the view that liability is not in your 
driver favour as your vehicle rolled backward and collided onto third party vehicle who was stationary behind your 
van. Therefore, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third party claim at best to avoid 
further litigation, which would escalate to even more cost. 
 
If you have evidence/Police Investigation Result to proof that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us 
have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 17/02/2021, after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third 
Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by 
you/your driver against the other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident. 
  
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to this Third-Party 
claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will 
be protected. 
  
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 14 February 2022 10:24 AM
To: Tan, Bennie-WZ
Subject: AIG Ref: 8682972390SG // LKK Ref: CC6/AIG21001360/Upa3 [ACCIDENT 

INVOLVING GBK 5135E(AIG) AND SMW 7659D ON 26/01/2021]

Hi Bennie, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have conducted inspection on 04/02/2021 at Specialists Motor Pte Ltd. Up-to-date, third party claimant did not 
send in car to workshop(Specialists Motor Pte Ltd) for repair. 
 
In view of the above, we will proceed to close file and submit WP report to your good office. 
 
Thank you. 
 
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 


