Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Heng Yap Seng Auto Services <hysauto1122@hotmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 10 March 2021 4:22 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: finalise

Hi,

We confirm to accept the final settlement.
Thank you.
Best regards,

Heng Yap Seng Auto Services

From: "Denise Tay (LKKAuto)" <denisetay@Ikkauto.com>

Date: Friday, 5 March 2021 at 2:16 PM

To: Heng Yap Seng Auto Services <hysauto1122@hotmail.com>
Subject: finalise

Hi Steven,

Finalize lump sum $5100, 6Days

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 26 February 2021 4:03 PM

To: Heng Yap Seng Auto Services <hysautol122@hotmail.com>
Subject: finalise

Hi Steven,

Offer lump sum $5100, 6Days



Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



