Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your acceptance.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Monday, 3 May 2021 9:27 AM

gerine@casgarage.sg cheng

Admin A; Aldrin Ang

RE: LOD: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML1316R & SDD121R ON 27/01/2021
DV_SML1316R.pdf

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: gerine@casgarage.sg cheng <gerine@casgarage.sg>

Sent: Friday, 30 April 2021 5:01 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Aldrin Ang <aldrin@casgarage.sg>
Subject: Re: LOD: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML1316R & SDD121R ON 27/01/2021

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Hsiao Tong,
Kindly let us have your DV asap.

Thank you and regards,

Gerine Cheng

Mobile: 9234 6445

Address: 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
#02-22/21/20



AutoBay Block D
Singapore 417883

On Thu, 29 Apr 2021 at 17:52, gerine@casgarage.sg cheng <gerine@casgarage.sg> wrote:
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We refer to your email dated 26.04.2021.

We are pleased to accept the offer at $,7730.00 at global sum basis.
Kindly let us have your discharge voucher as soon as possible.

Thank you and regards,

Gerine Cheng

Mobile: 9234 6445

Address: 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
#02-22/21/20

AutoBay Block D

Singapore 417883

On Mon, 26 Apr 2021 at 09:58, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to your below email.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $7,730.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: gerine@casgarage.sg cheng <gerine@casgarage.sg>

Sent: Monday, 12 April 2021 12:00 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Aldrin Ang <aldrin@casgarage.sg>
Subject: Re: LOD: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML1316R & SDD121R ON 27/01/2021

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We refer to your offer email dated 11.04.2021.

Regret to inform that we are unable to accept the offer at $7,630 under global sum basis.



As the accident took place on 27.01.2021, our client's vehicle is a new vehicle. Therefore, we have arranged a new
rental vehicle with similar capacity to assist him on his daily needs. Under NIMA rental rates benchmark, the
rental rate is ranged between $100-$120 per day. As both our client and the rental vehicles are relatively new, we
trust that $120/day is reasonable. | have enclosed herewith the log cards for both our client and rental vehicle for
your kind perusal.

In addition to this, as the survey was conducted on 29.01.2021 which was a Friday and we were awarded 6 repair
days to repair for the said vehicle. Therefore, 7 days of rental which crossed one Sunday (31.01.2021) is
reasonable too.

Therefore, kindly consider our previous offer.

1. Cost of Repair $7,028.10
2. 7 days Car Rental x $120.00 $840.00
3. LTA TP Search Fee $7.45

TOTAL $7,875.55

We thank you for your utmost attention on this matter and sincerely hope to receive a favourable reply from you
soon.

Thank you and regards,

Gerine Cheng

Mobile: 9234 6445

Address: 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
#02-22/21/20

AutoBay Block D

Singapore 417883

On Sun, 11 Apr 2021 at 11:03, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:
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Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of $7,630.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 17 March 2021 3:54 PM

To: gerine@casgarage.sg cheng <gerine@casgarage.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Aldrin Ang <aldrin@casgarage.sg>; Nicole Chong <nicole@casgarage.sg>
Subject: Fw: LOD: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML1316R & SDD121R ON 27/01/2021

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir / Madam,



Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

Hi Hsiao Tong,

FYNA, CC6/AIG21001332/Aps3

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Su Li| Admin Support

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: gerine@casgarage.sg cheng <gerine@casgarage.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, March 17, 2021 3:17 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Aldrin Ang <aldrin@casgarage.sg>; Nicole Chong <nicole@casgarage.sg>
Subject: LOD: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML1316R & SDD121R ON 27/01/2021

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Mdm

ACCIDENT ON 27-JAN-2021 INVOLVING SML1316R & SDD121R INSIDE MACTECH BUILDING CAR PARK
ENTRANCE

We are the repair workshop for the owner of vehicle SML1316R, which was involved in the captioned accident
with your insured's vehicle. The vehicle owner has requested and authorised us to assist him/her in presenting
their claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driver SDD121R, we are submitting these claims
for your consideration on behalf of the owner/driver/claimant.
6



1. Cost of Repair $7,028.10
2. 7 days Car Rental x $120.00 $840.00
3. LTA TP Search Fee $7.45

TOTAL $7,875.55

We enclose the following documents to support the claims:-
Repair Bill
GIA Report
Letter of Authorisation
LTA TP Search Invoice
Rental Invoice

Rental Agreement
Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our client's claim as soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal
injury claim (if any) of the owner/driver/claimant.

Thank you and regards,

Gerine Cheng

Address: 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
#02-22/21/20

AutoBay Block D

Singapore 417883




