Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Khim Goh <sinhweemotor@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 18 March 2021 3:36 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: ACCIDENT ON 09/01/21 INVOLVED SMF5066S AND ES8818X
Attachments: CCF18032021_0002.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong

Our client requested us to claim the following :-

1) Cost Of Repair $ 1100.00
2) Loss Of Use $ 400.00 ($100.00 x 4 days)
3) LTA Fee $7.45

Total amount  : $ 1507.45
Please kindly get back to us soon.

Thanks

Warmest Regards

Sin Hwee Motor Pte Ltd

Khim Hp : 9766 6672

Tel: 6745 5783 Fax : 6744 9582
E-mail: sinhweemotor@gmail.com




TO WHOM IT MAY CONGERN
LETTER OF AUTHORITY
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RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, SIN HWEE MOTOR PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/I have reached
an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
S81,100.00 (Repair Cost), $$300.00.(Loss of Use/Rental), $$7.45 (Disbursement) for vehicle no.
SMF 50668 that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 09/01/2021 (date) along
NEAR OPP BLK 635A KJE EXIT TO WOODLANDS RD(SLIP_RD) (location) involving
vehicle no/s ES 8818X. This is pursuant to the 1nqpect10n conducted on 22/01/2021 (datc) at “the
~workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am’authorized by the owner SIN LEE PENG CHRISTINA (the third
party claimant”) of vehicle no.. SMF 5066S make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and
we/I have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/I deem fit. We/I
enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”™.

We/l further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant™ after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for ariy loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the .
damage to SMF 50668 (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and ‘that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore .Courts have

-exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

I(ycar)

Dated this ‘9 1 (day) of 0\.{ : (month) 20

)

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “tL\erorkshop’.’ (with chop)




SIN HWEE MOTOR PTE LTD Invoice

REG NO: 201327079M

INVOICE NO: C1248
*#% Main Workshop *** :
DATE OF ISSUE 8/3/
Blk 3023A Ubi Road 1 #01-59 S(408717) . i
**% Spray Paint Workshop @ Autobay *** -
I Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, #01-25 S(417883) - | VEHIGLENO: SMF 5066 S
MAKE: SUBARU
'SIN LEE PENG CHRISTINA
MODEL: FORESTER
REF NO:
L QTY DESCRIPTI_ON UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
LUMP SUM ' 1,100.00 1,100.00

TOTAL: $1,100.00




> Back to OneMotoring
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Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701 .

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

; Print Date/Time : 19 Jan 2021 / 16:58:08 -

Receipt Date/Time : - 19 Jan 2021 / 16:58:08

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-210119-003027

Previous Receipt No. :

SIN Item Description/ £ Amount GST  Amount
Business Transaction Reference Yo Before Amount After GST
No. o GST (S$) (S%) (S$)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - ES8818X
As at 09 Jan 2021/21:41:00

- Insurance Co: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.

1 Insurance Enquiry - ES8818X

Enquiry Fee . ' ) 7.00 0.49 7.49
20210119165601665792 i .
Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable » 7.45
Paid By
451297 XXXXXX8320 eNETS Credit Card 7.45
Total 7.45
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 7.45
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee
. may apply.



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 9 February 2021 12:39 PM

To: PTYRCES@SINGNET.COM.SG

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING ES 8818X(AlG) AND SMF 5066S AT/ALONG KRANJI

EXPRESSWAY TOWARDS WOODLAND ROAD EXIT ON 09/01/2021

09 FEB 2021
Ms Susan Wee Poh Lang/ Mr Ng Hock Khee [By Email Only]
Dear Sir/Madam,

You Ref: ES8818X

Our Ref: CC6/A1G21001276/Aps3

ACCIDENT INVOLVING ES 8818X(AIG) AND SMF 5066S AT/ALONG KRANJI EXPRESSWAY TOWARDS WOODLAND
ROAD EXIT ON 09/01/2021

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. to deal with the third-party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SMF5066S against your insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is not in your driver favour as it is a head-to-rear
collision. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to this Third-Party
claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will
be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)
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Merimen e-Claims

Claim Audit

Claimant's Name: -> SIN LEE PENG CHRISTINA. [A] Lee Su Li

(204753) SUBARU FORESTER 2.0 I-L CVT AWD SR (A). [A] Lee Su Li

Reg No: SMF5066S. Acct Date: 2021/01/09. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lt

d. (SG). Workshop: Sin Hwee Motor Pte Ltd (HQ) [A] Lee Su Li
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] Lee Su Li
Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/02/05 [A] Lee Su Li
Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] Lee Su Li

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Ex [I] Merimen

press) Administrator

(19):Fastlane. [A] Lee Su Li

[None] -> ADRIAN LING [A] Lee Su Li
[I] Syed-

Downloaded SMF5066S vs ES8818X-TP VIDEO(REAR) Yusoff, Saliha

Downloaded SMF5066S vs ES8818X-TP VIDEO(REAR) Yu[slgff?;i-ha
[A] HUEY
YON

Claim Conclusion: -> 3. [A]Yg,L\IJEY

JP] Reg. Date: -> 2018/11/15. [ALSKEY

[A] HUEY
YON

Cur.Req:1507.45:Liability: 100%(B27) *Quantum: (a)COR: $1,100.00 + (b)LOU(4days x $100.00): $3
00.00 + (c)LTA/GIA search fee: $7.45 = Total: $1,507.45 *3recommendation repair days + 1PRS = 4d
ays *For your approval please.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/02/05. Mandate Remarks: please proceed with settlement @ $1,50 [1I] Syed-
7.45 [COR-$1,100 LOU-$400 LTA-$7.45] ** subject to final repair bill & ATA Yusoff, Saliha

Approved:1507.45:please proceed with settlement @ $1,507.45 [COR-$1,100 LOU-$400 LTA-$7.45] **  [I] Syed-
subject to final repair bill & ATA Yusoff, Saliha

i‘ 3 Ll Date To il 3 Ll Audit Type  None v

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

2665575

2668690

2683362

AIG Asia
LKK Auto o
28 Jan 2021 TP Case Motor Consultants Pacific SMF50665 ES8818X 11.00
14:19:21 (Insurer) Insurance Pte.
Pte Ltd
Ltd. (Express)
AIG Asia AIG Asia
08 Feb 2021 ) Pacific Pacific CHEW HSIAO
17:29:18 Video Upload Motor Insurance Pte. | Insurance Pte. SMF50665 TONG XXX
Ltd. Ltd. (SG)
LKK Auto LKK Auto
0513[:;5.2;)721 O(i{j}—lljs(t::rs)e Motor Consultants Consultants SMF5066S ES8818X 11.00
o Pte Ltd Pte Ltd (HQ)
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