Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 11 October 2021 4:52 PM
To: SUR

Cc: Chew Goon Motor(ad3)

Subject: Fw: SJZ6567L ; Acc date: 16.01.2021
Attachments: Chew Goon Motor.pdf

Hi Shiau Chan,

CS/MSG21001261/Kqd3

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) <ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 11 October 2021 4:29 pm

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SJZ6567L ; Acc date: 16.01.2021

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Kindly refer to the attached.

Thanks & Regards,
Kelly

Chew Goon Motor

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,
Ave 5 #01-15, 16 & 17,

Ang Mo Kio Autopoint
Singapore 568047

Tel : 6484 1626

Fax : 6484 0465

From: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) <ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, March 12, 2021 10:12:24 AM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SJZ6567L ; Acc date: 16.01.2021

Dear Kenneth,

Confirmed p/p - $ 1,541.07 and 2 days (before gst)



Thanks & Regards,
Kelly

Chew Goon Motor

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,
Ave 5 #01-15,16 & 17,

Ang Mo Kio Autopoint
Singapore 568047

Tel : 6484 1626

Fax : 6484 0465

From: Chew Goon Motor(ad3)

Sent: Friday, 5 March 2021 10:15 AM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SJZ6567L ; Acc date: 16.01.2021

Dear Kenneth,

Kindly refer to the attached.
This case is repair as part by part basic.

Thanks & Regards,
Kelly

Chew Goon Motor

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,
Ave 5 #01-15,16 & 17,

Ang Mo Kio Autopoint
Singapore 568047

Tel : 6484 1626

Fax : 6484 0465

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 4 March 2021 4:15 PM

To: Chew Goon Motor(ad3)

Subject: RE: SJZ6567L ; Acc date: 16.01.2021

Part or lump? | have not received your resurvey photos??

From: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) <ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 4 March 2021 3:59 pm

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SJZ6567L ; Acc date: 16.01.2021

Dear Kenneth,
Kindly refer to the attached estimate for finalise.

Thanks & Regards,
Kelly



Chew Goon Motor

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,
Ave 5 #01-15, 16 & 17,

Ang Mo Kio Autopoint
Singapore 568047

Tel : 6484 1626

Fax : 6484 0465



