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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: JWG CLAIMS <jwg.claims@yahoo.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 April 2021 3:40 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); SUR; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: GIA report and Estimate for Vehicle Number: GBF6489D-DOA: 26/1/21

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Veron, 

 

We confirm and accept the COR S$5,000.00/- for the stated vehicle with 5 working days. 

 

Thanks and Best Regards, 

 

Terence Toh 

JWG INTERNATIONAL PTE. LTD.    

 

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201837488H    

 

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,  

#03-08 AMK AutoPoint,  

Singapore 568047 

H/P: 8299 6103 | Fax: 6909 9592    

 

E-Mail: jwg.claims@yahoo.com    

 

 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Wednesday, April 28, 2021 9:19 AM 

To: JWG CLAIMS; SUR; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: GIA report and Estimate for Vehicle Number: GBF6489D-DOA: 26/1/21 

 

Dear Terence, 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Re-offer Lump Sum $5,000 @ 5 days 

 

Kindly confirm. 

 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: JWG CLAIMS <jwg.claims@yahoo.com>  

Sent: Monday, 15 March 2021 11:27 AM 
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To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) 

<MarcusChua@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: GIA report and Estimate for Vehicle Number: GBF6489D-DOA: 26/1/21 

 

 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Veron, 

 

We confirm and accept the COR S$5,350.00/- for the stated vehicle with 5 working days. 

 

Sorry for the tardiness 

 

Thanks and Best Regards, 

 

Terence Toh 

JWG INTERNATIONAL PTE. LTD.    

 

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201837488H    

 

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,  

#03-08 AMK AutoPoint,  

Singapore 568047 

H/P: 8299 6103 | Fax: 6909 9592    

 

E-Mail: jwg.claims@yahoo.com    

 

 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Monday, March 15, 2021 9:25 AM 

To: JWG CLAIMS; SUR; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: GIA report and Estimate for Vehicle Number: GBF6489D-DOA: 26/1/21 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

Without Prejudice 

 
Offer Lump Sum $5350 @ 5 days 
                                                                                                           
Please check confirmed 
 
Kindly forward after repair photos. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Wednesday, 3 March 2021 8:41 AM 
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To: JWG CLAIMS <jwg.claims@yahoo.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) 

<MarcusChua@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: GIA report and Estimate for Vehicle Number: GBF6489D-DOA: 26/1/21 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

Without Prejudice 

 
Offer Lump Sum $5350 @ 5 days 
                                                                                                           
Please check confirmed 
 
Kindly forward after repair photos. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 9 February 2021 11:43 AM 

To: JWG CLAIMS <jwg.claims@yahoo.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) 

<MarcusChua@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: GIA report and Estimate for Vehicle Number: GBF6489D-DOA: 26/1/21 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

Without Prejudice 

 
Offer Lump Sum $5350 @ 5 days 
                                                                                                           
Please check confirmed 
 
Kindly forward after repair photos. 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: JWG CLAIMS <jwg.claims@yahoo.com>  

Sent: Monday, 8 February 2021 10:05 AM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: GIA report and Estimate for Vehicle Number: GBF6489D 
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Without Prejudice 

 
Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

Forward the email for your pursuant. 

 

Thanks and Warmest Regards, 

JWG INTERNATIONAL PTE. LTD.    

 

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201837488H    

 

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,  

#03-08 AMK AutoPoint,  

Singapore 568047 

Tel: 8602 4590 Fax: 6909 9592       

 

E-Mail: jwg.claims@yahoo.com    

 

 

 

From: JWG CLAIMS 

Sent: Monday, February 8, 2021 9:46 AM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) 

Subject: GIA report and Estimate for Vehicle Number: GBF6489D 

 

Without Prejudice 

 
Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

GIA Report and Estimate for the stated vehicle as attached for you pursuant. 

 

Please acknowledge upon receipt of the email. 

 

Thanks and Warmest Regards, 

JWG INTERNATIONAL PTE. LTD.    

 

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201837488H    

 

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,  

#03-08 AMK AutoPoint,  

Singapore 568047 

Tel: 8602 4590 Fax: 6909 9592       

 

E-Mail: jwg.claims@yahoo.com    

 

 

 

 

 

 


