Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 4 March 2021 12:18 PM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: R SLT46X----- FINALIZE
RAEA: SK Admin

C&Ri%: 2021 4£ 3 A 4 H 12:17:16 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

Wk A Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)
#i%k: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Simon Koh; KY Leong; Tyson Koh; Falcoe Lee
FB: Re: SLT46X----- FINALIZE

Dear Guo Qiang,
Noted with thanks
Regards,

Huey Lee

SK Automobile Pte Ltd
Tel: 6789 5155 Fax: 6783 5155

On Thu, Mar 4, 2021 at 12:04 PM Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Huey Lee,

Confirmed COR $3250 before GST @ 2 working days.

Regards,

Guo Qiang

From: SK Admin [mailto:admin@skauto.com.sq]
Sent: Saturday, 6 February, 2021 12:09 PM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto); SUR; Admin A

Cc: Simon Koh; KY Leong; Tyson Koh; Falcoe Lee
Subject: SLT46X-----FINALIZE

Dear Guo Qiang,



Vehicle

No. : SLT46X
D.O.A : 17/01/2021
Date of Inspection : 27/01/2021
Part (-10%) $ 3,537.00
S/Nett 3 50.00
Labour $ 480.00
Total $ 4,067.00
L/S (after -20%) $ 3,253.60

We refer to the above matter.

Attached is the after repair photos for your attention, kindly assist us to finalize this case.

We appreciate your immediate attention to this matter.

Thank you.

Regards,
Huey Lee

SK Automobile Pte Ltd

Tel: 6789 5155 Fax: 6783 5155



