Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: EM Auto <emautosolution@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 9 March 2021 3:35 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: AXA-TP SLV 7716P DOA: 23/01/2021

Hi Shiau Chan,

Ok agreed.

Thanks < regards,

Bernard

Hp: 91018302

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 9 March, 2021 12:29 PM

To: EM Auto <emautosolution@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: AXA-TP SLV 7716P DOA: 23/01/2021

Dear Bernard,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Offer Lump Sum $2,500.00 and 5 repair days.

Kindly check and confirm.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



