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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 24 February 2021 2:00 PM

To: Goh Wee Dek; Su Li (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Pre-inspection SMH8243S & SLF8826H(CHINA TAIPING) on 23.01.21 LKK REF : 

CC3/CTI21001230/es3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Hi Sir/Mdm,   

 

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under 

BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement)  and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned 

case. 

  

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to 

your client’s vehicle.  

  

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the 

days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor. 

 

In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate 

settlement. 

 

•             Please do not send the LOD to our principal for direct settlement. 

  

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051 

 

 

Thank You.  

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

From: Goh Wee Dek <weedek.goh@premierauto.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 24 February 2021 1:12 PM 

To: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Pre-inspection SMH8243S & SLF8826H(CHINA TAIPING) on 23.01.21 LKK REF : CC3/CTI21001230/es3 

 
Dear Su Li/Asher 

 

We would like to check the liability for this case. 

 

Regards 

 

Goh Wee Dek 

Assistant Claims Manager 

Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd 

  

Address:  23  Changi  So uth Ave 2 ,  #01-02 S ingapore 486443 

Tel :  6214 8880 EXT:  068  |   DID:    6544 6682  |   Fax:    6214 1511 

Premier Taxis Pte Ltd |  Premier Rent A Car Pte Ltd |  Premier Automotive Services  Pte Ltd |  Premier Land (East) 

Pte Ltd |  Premier Realty  Pte Ltd  

Vis i t  us  at :  www.premier-rentacar .com  |  www.premiertaxi .com.sg  

 

 
N o t e :  P l e a s e  b e  i n f o r m e d  t h a t  w e  h a v e  c h a n g e d  o u r  e m a i l  f r o m  w e e d e k . g o h @ p r e m i e r t a x i . c o m  t o  

w e e d e k . g o h @ p r e m i e r a u t o . c o m . s g  

Confidentiality Notice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential or 
proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact 
the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message. 

 
 Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION 
 
 

 

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) [mailto:suli@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 26 January 2021 3:49 pm 

To: Goh Wee Dek <weedek.goh@premierauto.com.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Liew Hai Leong <haileong.liew@premierauto.com.sg>; Vincent Chua <vincent.chua@premierauto.com.sg>; 

Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: Pre-inspection SMH8243S & SLF8826H(CHINA TAIPING) on 23.01.21 LKK REF : CC3/CTI21001230/es3 

 
Without Prejudice  
 

Dear Sir / Madam,  
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Please be informed that we are currently pending for our principal to release OI GIA report. 

  

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Asher via email. 

  

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

  

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned 

  

  

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 

claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

                                                               

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Su Li| Admin Support 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, January 26, 2021 2:25 PM 

To: 'Goh Wee Dek' <weedek.goh@premierauto.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A 

<admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'Liew Hai Leong' <haileong.liew@premierauto.com.sg>; 'Vincent Chua' <vincent.chua@premierauto.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: Pre-inspection SMH8243S & SLF8826H(CHINA TAIPING) on 23.01.21  
  
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
Noted with thanks. 
 
 
 
BEST REGARDS 
G.NIVITHA 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Goh Wee Dek <weedek.goh@premierauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 26 January 2021 2:09 PM 
To: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Liew Hai Leong <haileong.liew@premierauto.com.sg>; Vincent Chua <vincent.chua@premierauto.com.sg> 
Subject: Pre-inspection SMH8243S & SLF8826H(CHINA TAIPING) on 23.01.21 
 
Dear All 
 
We refer to the above mentioned. 
 
We are claiming against China Taiping. 
 
Kindly arrange for survey 
 
*Vehicle in workshop* 
 
Regards 
 
Goh Wee Dek 
Assistant Claims Manager 
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd 
  
Address: 23 Changi South Ave 2, #01-02 Singapore 486443 
Tel: 6214 8880 EXT: 068  |  DID:   6544 6682  |  Fax:   6214 1511 Premier Taxis Pte Ltd | Premier Rent A Car Pte 
Ltd | Premier Automotive Services  Pte Ltd | Premier Land (East) Pte Ltd | Premier Realty  Pte Ltd Visit us at: 
www.premier-rentacar.com | www.premiertaxi.com.sg 
 
 
Note: Please be informed that we have changed our email from weedek.goh@premiertaxi.com to 
weedek.goh@premierauto.com.sg 
 
Confidentiality Notice | This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended 
recipient(s) and may contain confidential or proprietary information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or 
distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, immediately contact the sender by reply e-mail and 
destroy all copies of the original message. 
 
Π Please Consider Your Environmental Responsibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and 
REDUCE POLLUTION Π 
 
 
 
--  
This email has been checked for viruses by AVG. 
https://www.avg.com 


