Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 6 May 2021 11:13 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: VACS : Request Estimation Approval for Case Reference Number: TAX/01/21/2045 -
SHB630B (TS)

Attachments: RE: VACS : Request Estimation Approval for Case Reference Number: TAX/01/21/2045 -

SHB630B (TS)

From: Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Svcs/FM(Mil)&SS/Acc. Repair/Acc. Repair) [mailto:YeoPohsuan@smrt.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 6 May, 2021 11:09 AM

To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: VACS : Request Estimation Approval for Case Reference Number: TAX/01/21/2045 - SHB630B (TS)

Hi

FYL.

From: Lynn Gan Peh Ling (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr) <LynnGanPehLingYanPeiling@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: 29/01/2021 11:55

To: Kok Tuck Foo (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Taxis) <TuckFoo@smrt.com.sg>; Zhu Hui (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Drivers' Mgt/CM)
<ZHUHUl@smrt.com.sg>; TAXIS-CREDIT MGT-CR CONTROL <TAXIS-CREDITMGT-CRCONTROL@smrt.com.sg>; Yip Shung
Chi, Darren (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr) <YipShungChiDarren@smrt.com.sg>

Cc: Gerald Tan Chwee Hock (Auto Sves/ARC/ARC/Buses) <tanchweehock@smrt.com.sg>; Yeo Poh Suan (Auto
Svcs/ARC/ARC/Taxis) <YeoPohsuan@smrt.com.sg>; Peh Eng Hock (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Taxis)
<PehEngHock@smrt.com.sg>; Chin Kim Ming (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Taxis) <kimming.chin@smrt.com.sg>; Keith Ang Bang
Kien (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Taxis) <ANGBANGKIEN@smrt.com.sg>; Loh Fong Soon (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Taxis)
<LohFS@smrtlan.com.sg>; Koo Yew Chung (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC) <YewChung@smrt.com.sg>; Chong Fei Yuan (Auto
Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA) <FeiYuan@smrt.com.sg>; Balgish Binte Abdul Halil (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims &
IA/Buses) <BalgishBAH@smrt.com.sg>; Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses)
<ChanSiauChin@smrt.com.sg>; Low Thian Seng (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & 1A/Buses) <ThianSeng@smrt.com.sg>;
Magnaye Ana Margie Marasigan (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis) <ManaMargie@smrt.com.sg>; Selena Tan
Lee See (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & I1A/Taxis) <TanSelena@smrt.com.sg>; Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims &
IA/Claims & IA/Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>; Tan Wei Teck (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses)
<TanWeiTeck@smrt.com.sg>; Wong Kok Wah (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA) <WongKokWah@smrt.com.sg>;
Claudia Lynn Liu Shujing (Auto Svcs/Taxi Maint/Taxi WS/Admin) <LiuShujing@smrt.com.sg>; Shanti B Thaiyal Nayagi
(Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis) <BThaiyalN@smrt.com.sg>; Grace Ng Siu Ching (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Taxis)
<ngsiuching@smrt.com.sg>; Goh Kok Khoon (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Buses) <GohKK2 @smrt.com.sg>; Gan Kwai Leng (Auto
Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis) <GANKWAILENG@smrt.com.sg>; Lim Ming Huey
(Fin/FBP(NonRail)/Roads/Taxis/Taxis) <LimMingHuey@smrt.com.sg>; Eileen Chew Ee Lin (Buses/Bus HQ/Bus Opns/Ops
PIng) <EileenChewEeLin@smrt.com.sg>; Kee Sook Meng (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Taxis) <SookMeng@smrt.com.sg>; Ong
Hua Yen (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <OngHuaYen@smrt.com.sg>; Ashlene Lee Bee Gan (Auto
Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis) <LeeBeeGan@smrt.com.sg>; Seah June Woei (Auto Svcs/Taxi Maint)
<SeahJuneWoei@smrt.com.sg>; Lim Wei Siong (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Taxis) <weisiong@smrt.com.sg>; Lim
Kha Chiew (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Taxis) <limkhachiew@smrtlan.com.sg>; Eldon Lim Sing Yeow (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet
Svr) <LimSingYeow@smrt.com.sg>; TPHS-Ops-Maint-FleetSvr <TPHS_Ops-Maint_FleetSvr@smrtcorp.onmicrosoft.com>;
TAXIS-CREDITMGT-C&B <TAXIS-CREDITMGT-C&B@smrt.com.sg>; TPHS-Ops&Maint-ENF <TPHS-OpsMaint-



ENF@smrt.com.sg>
Subject: FW: VACS : Request Estimation Approval for Case Reference Number: TAX/01/21/2045 - SHB630B (TS)

Hi Tuck Foo,

Please Do Not Repair SHBG630B, as this taxi will be written off due to “Beyond Economical Repair”.

Aside to Zhu Hui,

Please take note that taxi is to be scrapped and TS partner is liable to pay the repair contribution instead of total
loss.

Attached is the email approval for your reference.

Kindly advise the last rental date and time after the BER flag has been raised and job card is closed.

Aside to Credit Control,
Please assist to call and inform TS partner regarding the payment.

Aside to Darren,
For your noting, please.

4524446 SHEGICHE 03052014 & Yaur 4 Moathy SrARING

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Lynn

From: Damian Chan Wee Siong (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr) <DamianChan@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: 28 January 2021 14:59

To: Teo Yook Lian (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr) <teoyk@smrt.com.sg>

Cc: Timothy Yap Thian Woon (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr) <YapTimothy@smrt.com.sg>; Michael Templar
(TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr) <michaeltem@smrt.com.sg>; Lynn Gan Peh Ling (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr)
<LynnGanPehLingYanPeiling@smrt.com.sg>; Yip Shung Chi, Darren (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr)
<YipShungChiDarren@smrt.com.sg>

Subject: RE: VACS : Request Estimation Approval for Case Reference Number: TAX/01/21/2045 - SHB630B (TS)

Rejected in VACS, write off due to BER.
Pls hold the deregistration until we are ready to write off in the new FY.

Thanks.

From: Teo Yook Lian (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr) <teoyk@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, January 28, 2021 2:38 PM

To: Damian Chan Wee Siong (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr) <DamianChan@smrt.com.sg>

Cc: Timothy Yap Thian Woon (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr) <YapTimothy@smrt.com.sg>; Michael Templar
(TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr) <michaeltem@smrt.com.sg>; Lynn Gan Peh Ling (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr)
<LynnGanPehLingYanPeiling@smrt.com.sg>; Yip Shung Chi, Darren (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr)
<YipShungChiDarren@smrt.com.sg>

Subject: FW: VACS : Request Estimation Approval for Case Reference Number: TAX/01/21/2045 - SHB630B (TS)




Hi Damian,

Based on the financial model, it recommends us to SCrap SHB630B (Fault code BP).
The repair cost quoted is $14,700.00 (as shown in system) by the surveyor.

For your Approval/Rejection if we should proceed with the repair in VACS please.

:5T-13797-1D

stimation

Jeneral Estimation Details  Spare Part Cost Detail  Labour, Spray and Other Cost Detail  Estimation Date Details  Estimatic

TR T ST T S T ETTETETS
& Total Spare Part Cost $38,320.28 & $11,274,
& Total Labour Cost $1,650.00 & $1,2000
£ Total Spray Cost £4,266.00 & $1,2800
A Total Other Cost $3,251.00 8 $970.00
B Total Cost $47,527.28 8 14724,
8 Lump Sum Repair 8
Option
& Lump Sum Repair $47,550.00 8 $14,700.
& Number of Repair & Initial Nut
Days 140 Repair Da
& Estimator Remarks Total number of repair days = 10 days. 8 Latest Nu
SUP = + 4 days. Repair Da
LMEYOr
&g ¥
Amount
& su TVEYOr



Input Sheet

Input in highlighter green

Curent Date 28-Jan-21
Taxi No SHBG630B |
Model PRIUS |
Date registered J-3ep-14 |
ﬂ;e G yr= 4 mths
Total Costs [-514,700 |
Cash flows from scrap

Scrap value of taxi 500

COE rebate (LTA website) 310,070

PARF rebate (LTA website) |55,257
Original COE {SAP cost) §50,704

End of life PARF (SAP cost) 54,852

Hired out rate

Rental Rate Yr 1
Rental Rate Yr 2
Rental Rate Yr 3
Rental Rate Yr 4
Rental Rate Yr &
Rental Rate Yr &
Rental Rate Yr 7
Rental Rate Yr &

W oW e B B B B w

Regards
Yook Lian

From: vacs-admin <_vacs-admin@smrtcorp.onmicrosoft.com>

Results 5 years 6 years

PV repair NA NA !
PV scrap NA NA !
DECISION NA NA
Accident repair cost 514,700 S0
Auto's logsi(profit) on maintenance |50

Price difference (PQP vs COE) S0

Total cost (less Auto's profit) 214 700

Sent: 28 January, 2021 1:42 PM
To: Michael Templar (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr) <michaeltem@smrt.com.sg>; Lynn Gan Peh Ling

(TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr) <LynnGanPehLingYanPeiling@smrt.com.sg>; Teo Yook Lian (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr)

90.00%] Input expected hire out rate going forward

<teoyk@smrt.com.sg>; Timothy Yap Thian Woon (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr) <YapTimothy@smrt.com.sg>
Subject: VACS : Request Estimation Approval for Case Reference Number: TAX/01/21/2045

Hi,

This is to request you to approve the Estimation provided for the case mentioned below:

Case Reference Number: TAX/01/21/2045

Vehicle Registration Number: SHB630B

Make: TOYOTA

Model: PRIUS



Vehicle Registration Date: 03/09/2014

Fault Code: BP

Accident Date and Time: 22/01/2021 11:40 AM
Accident Report Date and Time: 22/01/2021 02:53 PM
Type of Accident: Head to Rear

Total Spare Cost: $38,320.28

Total Labour Cost: $1,690.00

Total Spray Cost: $4,266.00

Total Other Cost: $3,251.00

Total Repair Cost: $S47,527.28

Kindly login to VACS for more details and to approve/reject the estimate.

https://smrt2.crm5.dynamics.com/main.aspx?pagetype=entityrecord&etc=10093&id={F3080A01-175D-EB11-A812-
002248562B6B}

Thanks

SMRT Auto Services

DISCLAIMER

This electronic mail message and any files transmitted with it are intended exclusively for the individual or entity to
which it is addressed. The message, together with any attachment, may contain confidential and/or privileged
information. Any unauthorized review, use, printing, saving, copying, disclosure or distribution is strictly prohibited. If
you, the reader is not the intended recipient, please do not disclose, disseminate, circulate, copy or use any of the
information contained in this e-mail. Please notify us immediately and delete the e-mail and destroy any printed copy.



