Elaine (LKK Auto)

To: ODsupport

Cc: 'SUR'; 'Huey Yon (LKKAuto)'

Subject: RE: Total Loss Report & Invoice of Vehicle SHB 630B NTUC Ref: MT/1118386-006
Attachments: NACInspection.pdf

Dear Carol,

Enclosed here with inspection report.
Thank You.

Best Regards,

Elaine | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933

From: ODsupport [mailto:ODsupport@income.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 27 January 2022 8:36 AM

To: Elaine (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Total Loss Report & Invoice of Vehicle SHB 630B NTUC Ref: MT/1118386-006
Classification: Restricted

Hi Elaine,

Pls send me a complete set which workshop the vehicle has sent for survey. Tks

Regards

Admin Assistant
Operations, Motor & Personal Lines (PL)

(U

made yours

From: Elaine (LKK Auto) <report@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 26 January 2022 4:52 pm




To: ODsupport <ODsupport@income.com.sg>
Cec: 'SUR' <sur@Ikkauto.com>; 'Huey Yon (LKKAuto)' <hueyyon @Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Total Loss Report & Invoice of Vehicle SHB 630B NTUC Ref: MT/1118386-006

Dear Sir / Madam,

Enclose Total Loss Report of SHB 630B.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Elaine | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933

Disclaimer

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s)
named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all
copies of it. Thank you.



