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Re: ACCD INLVG SKZ3639X AND SJB4077Z ON 22/01/2021

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sun 9/5/2021 10:42 AM
To:  Peggy <nphauto@pacific.net.sg>

1 attachments (212 KB)
DV_SKZ3639X.pdf;

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your acceptance.

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary ac�on. 

“Kindly note that this nego�a�on between par�es on this ma�er is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole inten�on of

resolving the ma�er amicably without par�es resor�ng to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this nego�a�on of terms/se�lement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, therea�er, by the nego�a�on terms/se�lement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Peggy <nphauto@pacific.net.sg> 
Sent: Wednesday, 5 May 2021 1:16 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCD INLVG SKZ3639X AND SJB4077Z ON 22/01/2021
 
Dear Hsiao Tong
 
We prepare to accept your offer for $8000.00 all in.
 
Please let us have your payment soon.
 
 
REGARDS
 
PEGGY FOO
NPH AUTO SERVICE
TEL: 67840663
EMAIL: peggy@nphauto.com
 
 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 5 May 2021 8:33 AM 

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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To: Peggy <nphauto@pacific.net.sg> 
Subject: RE: ACCD INLVG SKZ3639X AND SJB4077Z ON 22/01/2021
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We refer to the above ma�er.
 
We propose se�lement at a global sum of $8,000.00(all-in).
 
Please confirm acceptance.
 
 
“Kindly note that this nego�a�on between par�es on this ma�er is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole inten�on of
resolving the ma�er amicably without par�es resor�ng to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this nego�a�on of terms/se�lement.

 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, therea�er, by the nego�a�on terms/se�lement.”
 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 9 March 2021 5:02 PM 
To: Peggy <nphauto@pacific.net.sg> 
Subject: RE: ACCD INLVG SKZ3639X AND SJB4077Z ON 22/01/2021
 
Without Prejudice
 
Hi Peggy,
 
We are preparing report to seek mandate from our principal.
 
We will expedite the ma�er and get back to you.
 
Kindly bear with us for �me being.
 
“Kindly note that this nego�a�on between par�es on this ma�er is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole inten�on of
resolving the ma�er amicably without par�es resor�ng to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this nego�a�on of terms/se�lement.

 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, therea�er, by the nego�a�on terms/se�lement.”
 

 

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:nphauto@pacific.net.sg


5/9/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/deeplink?popoutv2=1&version=20210426004.08 3/3

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 

From: Peggy <nphauto@pacific.net.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 9 March 2021 10:46 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: ACCD INLVG SKZ3639X AND SJB4077Z ON 22/01/2021
 
Hi Hsiao Tong
 
We refer to our le�er dated on 04/02/2021.
 
Please let us have your reply soon for this case.
 
 
REGARDS
 
PEGGY FOO
NPH AUTO SERVICE
TEL: 67840663
EMAIL: peggy@nphauto.com
 
 
 
From: Peggy [mailto:nphauto@pacific.net.sg]  
Sent: Thursday, 4 February 2021 9:56 AM 
To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: ACCD INLVG SKZ3639X AND SJB4077Z ON 22/01/2021
 
Hi Hsiao Tong
 
We refer to the above ma�er.
 
A�ach LOD, LOA and GIA fee,
 
Please let us have your reply soon.
 
 
REGARDS
 
PEGGY FOO
NPH AUTO SERVICE
TEL: 67840663
EMAIL: peggy@nphauto.com
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