Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 22 February 2021 3:27 PM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: SLT1755B-XIN YUN AUTO

Hi Shiau Chan,
Case finalised at $6100 / 9 days of lump sum repair

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Xin Yun Auto [mailto:xinyunautol@gmail.com]
Sent: Saturday, 20 February, 2021 10:40 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SLT1755B-XIN YUN AUTO

Dear Rasual,

Thank you, please proceed to close this case, thanks.
Can i have the $6100 marking for our submission, thank you so much.

Best Regards,

Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto

Tel/Fax:6634 0858

Mobile: 9839 1555
Email:xinyunautol @gmail.com

On Wed, Feb 17, 2021 at 9:28 AM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Yi Xin,

Request for this 2 item part prices remained the same. Total amount is $ 6,100 / 9 days of lump sump repair

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
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Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Xin Yun Auto [mailto:xinyunautol@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 10 February, 2021 11:38 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SLT1755B-XIN YUN AUTO

Dear Rasul,

Thanks for your email, but the marking was too low to accept, i give an example,
Bumper $460 -30%=$322, lower than our purchase price,
Tailgate $1000-30%=$700, lower than our purchase price.

This vehicle has no 2nd hand parts available on the market, all we replaced are new items.

Thanks and best regards
Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto
Tel/Fax:6634 0858

Mobile: 9839 1555

Email:xinyunautol @gmail.com




On Wed, Feb 10, 2021 at 11:17 AM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Yi Xin,

Refer to attachment for the finalised amount
Audit check that part prices is a little bit high, require to be reduce
Finalised amount is $ 5,700 / 9 days of lump sum repair

Kindly confirm

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Xin Yun Auto [mailto:xinyunautol@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 27 January, 2021 11:36 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: SLT1755B-XIN YUN AUTO

Dear Rasul



Please refer to the attached GIA report, estimate, final pictures and collection dv for your attention, thank
you.

Looking forwards to hearing from you soonest,
Best Regards,

Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto

Tel/Fax:6634 0858

Mobile: 9839 1555

Email:xinyunautol @gmail.com




