5/18/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: SMR2560M// DOA: 14/01/2021

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Tue 18/5/2021 2:17 PM

To: pingi@polymath.com.sg <pingi@polymath.com.sg>
Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that there is no concrete evidence to establish liability, we are unable to commit that
BOLA 28g applies for this incident as per scene photo.

We are unable to proceed Direct Settlement for this matter.

Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: pingi@polymath.com.sg <pingi@polymath.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 22 February 2021 3:46 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SMR2560M

Dear Hsiao Tong
Sorry for late reply iv had check with my client and we don't have any video footage nor accident
scene photo.

Best Regards,
Pin Qi
M: +65 9382 4402
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Disclaimer: The information transmitted is intended only for the person or entity to
which it is addressed and may contain confidential and/or privileged material. Any
review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or taking of any action in
reliance upon this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient
is prohibited. If you receive this in error, please contact the sender and delete the
material from any computer.

On 2021-01-29 15:40, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) wrote:
Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for your email.

Please be informed that liability is unclear. Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy
reference.

As per Il instruction, we would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our
necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on
the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement."

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: pingi@polymath.com.sg <pingi@polymath.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 29 January 2021 3:07 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SMR2560M

Dear Officer,
As enclose is a copy of doc for the moto claim accident for SMR2560M.

Best Regards,
Pin Qi
M: +65 9382 4402
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Polymath Garage Pte Ltd| 10 Kaki Bukit Road 2, #01-21 First East Centre,
Singapore 417868 |

24Hour : +65 8228 9818 | Tel: +65 6871 8861 | Email: enquiry@polymath.com.sg

Disclaimer: The information transmitted is intended only for the person or
entity to which it is addressed and may contain confidential and/or privileged
material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or taking
of any action in reliance upon this information by persons or entities other
than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you receive this in error, please
contact the sender and delete the material from any computer.
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