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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 January 2021 11:23 AM

To: Claims Dept; SUR

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SBX 777 S DOA: 11/1/2021

Dear Tony, 

 

We have confirmed with AIG, the excess is $1,500.00. 

 
Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Claims Dept <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 19 January 2021 10:05 AM 

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: OD CLAIM FOR SBX 777 S DOA: 11/1/2021 

 

Dear Shiau Chan, 

 

Noted on repair approval. Can reconfirm with OIC on the excess amount? 

 

It should be excess $2000 instead of $1500?  

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

Tony Foong 

Claims Advisor 

 

 
(Reg No 199902271W) 
55 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408699  

p. +65 6366 2323,  d. +65 67689828 
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