Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Attachments:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your acceptance.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Wednesday, 14 April 2021 5:26 PM

yeeauto pteltd

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF3686C & GBK3238E ON 13 JAN 2021LKK Ref:
CC4/11121000765/ps3

DV_SLF3686C.pdf

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return together with the following document to us (LKK) for our necessary

action: -

e Authorisation to act signed by your client.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 April 2021 5:36 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF3686C & GBK3238E ON 13 JAN 2021LKK Ref: CC4/11121000765/ps3

Good day Hsiao Tong

We accept amount $2400.00(all-in)

Thanks & Regards

Ms Phang
Yee Auto Pte Ltd



160 Sin Ming Drive

#02-17 Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

ROC & GST No.: 201719251W

email: yeeautopteltd@gmail.com
Contact No: 6457 2625 Fax: 6252 8459

On Sat, 10 Apr 2021 at 13:56, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:
Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/mdm,
We refer to the above matter.
We propose settlement at a global sum of $2,400.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 11 March 2021 1:15 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF3686C & GBK3238E ON 13 JAN 2021LKK Ref: CC4/11121000765/ps3

Good day Hsiao
As per attached for your reference and action
Thanks & Regards

Yee Auto Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive

#02-17 Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

ROC & GST No.: 201719251W

email: yeeautopteltd@gmail.com
Contact No: 6457 2625 Fax: 6252 8459

On Fri, 5 Mar 2021 at 17:20, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice



Hi,

Kindly provide a copy of your client’s video footage for our viewing. Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@l|kkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 5 March 2021 3:38 PM

To: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd@gmail.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Fw: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF3686C & GBK3238E ON 13 JAN 2021LKK Ref: CC4/11121000765/ps3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.



Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

Hi Hsiao Tong,

FYNA, CC4/11121000765/Kps3

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Su Li| Admin Support

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, March 5, 2021 3:30 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF3686C & GBK3238E ON 13 JAN 2021LKK Ref: CC4/11121000765/ps3

Good day Sirs,

LKK Ref: CC4/11121000765/ps3



ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF3686C & GBK3238E ON 13 JAN 2021 ALONG BLK 663A
JURONG WEST STREET 65

We attached accident report, LOD, repair bill, motor claim discharge and rental agreement

Thanks & Regards

Ms Phang

Yee Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive
#02-17 Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

ROC & GST No.: 201719251W

email: yeeautopteltd@gmail.com

Contact No: 6457 2625 Fax: 6252 8459



