Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 February 2021 4:42 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: ESTIMATE - ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SKW8254E, doa 3/12/2020 (FC Insured -
SHB4598K)

Hi Asher,

Any updates?
Thank you.

Rgds

June

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Tel : 67556142

Fax : 67557719

Email- chmotor@singnet.com.sg

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, February 11, 2021 12:29 PM

To: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor)

Subject: RE: ESTIMATE - ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SKW8254E, doa 3/12/2020 (FC Insured - SHB4598K)

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

HiJune,
We are still checking with our principal, shall revert to you in due course.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 | did: 6841-6051
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 9 February 2021 2:08 PM



To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: ESTIMATE - ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SKW8254E, doa 3/12/2020 (FC Insured - SHB4598K)

Hi Asher,
Kindly update on liability .
Thank you.

Rgds

June

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Tel : 67556142

Fax : 67557719

Email- chmotor@singnet.com.sg

From: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor)

Sent: Saturday, February 6, 2021 10:55 AM

To: Asher LKK Sng (LKK Auto)

Subject: Fw: ESTIMATE - ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SKW8254E, doa 3/12/2020 (FC Insured - SHB4598K)

RE-SEND
Thank you.

Rgds

June

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Tel : 67556142

Fax : 67557719

Email- chmotor@singnet.com.sg

From: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor)

Sent: Tuesday, February 2, 2021 11:32 AM

To: Asher LKK Sng (LKK Auto)

Subject: ESTIMATE - ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SKW8254E, doa 3/12/2020 (FC Insured - SHB4598K)

Hi Asher,
Mr Kenneth had conducted the survey.

Pls advise on liability asap.
Thank you.

Rgds

June

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Tel : 67556142

Fax : 67557719

Email- chmotor@singnet.com.sg

From: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor)
Sent: Friday, January 22, 2021 5:38 PM
To: Asher LKK Sng (LKK Auto)



Subject: Fw: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SKW8254E, doa 3/12/2020 (FC Insured - SHB4598K)
Hi Asher,

Pls advise on liability soonest.

Thank you.

Rgds

June

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Tel : 67556142

Fax : 67557719
Email- chmotor@singnet.com.sg

From: Su Li (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, January 21, 2021 2:07 PM

To: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) ; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Fw: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SKW8254E, doa 3/12/2020 (FC Insured - SHB4598K)

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Asher,

FYNA, CC4/FCI21000760/es3

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Su Li| Admin Support

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



From: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, January 21, 2021 1:45 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>
Subject: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - SKW8254E, doa 3/12/2020 (FC Insured - SHB4598K)

Dear Sir,

OUR CLIENT - SKW8254E
DATE

(o)

FACC : 3/12/2020 @ 0810am
FC

INS

URED : SHB4598K

Attached our client report.
Pls let us have a copy of the report /sketch on SHB4598K is you have it.
Also pls advise who is the officer-in-charge?

Thank you.

Regards

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (YISHUN Branch)
Tel : 67556142

Fax : 67557719



