Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 5 April 2021 10:32 AM

To: Reports (LKKAuto); 'Stanley Lai'

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SMN 1323J ; YOUR REF : SMC 8618Y - DOA ON 02/01/2021 || C10008710/KY
Attachments: LKKInvoice1.pdf; LKKPreRepairlnspection.pdf

Dear Stanley,
Enclosed amended report.

Sorry for the inconvenience caused.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Reports (LKKAuto) <report@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 5 April 2021 9:57 AM

To: 'Stanley Lai' <stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SMN 1323)J ; YOUR REF : SMC 8618Y - DOA ON 02/01/2021 || C10008710/KY

Dear Stanley,

Thank you for the email.

Dear Denise kindly assist.

From: Stanley Lai [mailto:stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg]

Sent: Saturday, 3 April 2021 5:59 PM

To: Elaine (LKK Auto)

Cc: Justin Wong; 'SUR'

Subject: RE: SMN 1323)J ; YOUR REF : SMC 8618Y - DOA ON 02/01/2021 || C10008710/KY

Hi Huey Yon,

Kindly confirm date of accident listed on survey invoice if it is supposed to be 13/01/2021 instead of 02/01/2021.
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Do amend the invoice and resent us for payment processing please.
Thank you.

Regards,

Stanley Lai
Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2189
F +65 6725 0853
E stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg
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auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct
Insurance.

From: Huey Yon <report@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 29 March 2021 2:42 PM

To: lvy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>

Subject: SMIN 1323J ; YOUR REF : SMC 8618Y - DOA ON 02/01/2021 || C10008710/KY

Dear lvy,

Enclosed the survey report.

Thanks & Regards,



Huey Yon | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933
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Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.
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