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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>
Sent: February 8, 2021 4:26 PM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING  SKH1091H  AND AIG INSURED SCX220U   DATED 

26/12/2020 LKK REF : CC6/AIG21000744/bs3
Attachments: SKH1091H.pdf; SKH1091H Letter of Authority.pdf

Dear  Jasper , 
 
 
We submit our claim as follow :  
 
 
Repair cost S$ 1995.00 
Loss of Use        200.00 
 
Please let us have your offer to settle. 
 
 
 
 
Thank you & Best  Regards, 
Jouis Seow  
Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd 
Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10  
Singapore 539195. 
  
Tel        : (65) 62898126 
Fax       : (65) 62870590 
Email    : jouis@jinauto.com.sg  
  
 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) [mailto:jasperchua@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 20 January 2021 9:44 AM 
To: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH1091H AND AIG INSURED SCX220U DATED 26/12/2020 LKK REF : 
CC6/AIG21000744/bs3 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
We confirm direct settlement based on BOLA 24(a). 
 
Thanks  
 

2,033.00



SKH1091H SCX220U 26/12/2020

SKH1091H



 

 

 
RELEASE VOUCHER 

(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim) 
 

 
“We/I, JIN AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop”) hereby confirm that we/I have 
reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK 
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for 
S1,050.00 (Global Sum) for vehicle no SKH 1091H that was damaged pursuant to the accident 
which occurred on 26/12/2020 (date) along KAMPONG COMMUNITY CLUB@ JALAN 
BATU (location) involving vehicle no/s SCX 220U. 
 
This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 27/01/2021 (date) at “the workshop”. 
 

We/I confirm that we/I are/am authorized by the owner CHIA MIA CHIANG  (“the third party 
claimant”) of vehicle no SKH 1091H make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/I 
have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/I deem fit. We/I enclose 
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”. 
 
We/I further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages, 
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party 
claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and 
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the 
damage to SKH 1091H (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident. 
 
We/I confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the 
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a 
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.  
 
This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have 
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.  
 
 
Dated this _________ (day) of _____________ (month) 2021 (year) 
 
 
 
 
___ ____________________     ______________________________ 
Signed by appointed surveyor     Signed by “the workshop” (with chop) 

JUNE18TH
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 20 January 2021 9:31 AM
To: jtan2010sg@gmail.com
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCX 220U AND SKH 1091H ON 26/12/2020

Our Ref: CC6/AIG21000744/bs3                                                             
 
26 DECEMBER 2020                                                                          
                                                                 
TAN KHOON HUI JOHNNY 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCX 220U AND SKH 1091H ON 26/12/2020 
 
We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against 
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 
 
Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or your authorized driver may 
not be absolved from blame for this accident. 
 
If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have them in 
writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 30/01/2021, after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant 
on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against 
the other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial 
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will 
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.  
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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CHIA MIA CHIANG


Dec 26 2020 10:00AM

[TAN KHOON HUI JOHNNY]


Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd



 



From   AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 23/04/2021 01:02 AM.
To   LKK_HQ
Subject   Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$1050.00) - SKH1091H - Claim Handler: Tan, Bennie-WZ


Approved:1050.00:Subj to all docs/billings in order, settle at best: $1000-1050 (All-in). Liab: 50%(BOLA24a)

 
DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
 There are no documents.





https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCobj&fuseaction=dsp_objlink&domainid=1&objid=982844&extid=353767&CFID=85501853&CFTOKEN=944583d2d43bc5eb-C6BB95CF-0895-7699-48812370E32D7BA2&USID=10684&RID=9862281
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=85501853&CFTOKEN=944583d2d43bc5eb-C6BB95CF-0895-7699-48812370E32D7BA2&USID=10684&RID=9862281
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=85501853&CFTOKEN=944583d2d43bc5eb-C6BB95CF-0895-7699-48812370E32D7BA2&USID=10684&RID=9862281
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=85501853&CFTOKEN=944583d2d43bc5eb-C6BB95CF-0895-7699-48812370E32D7BA2&USID=10684&RID=9862281
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=85501853&CFTOKEN=944583d2d43bc5eb-C6BB95CF-0895-7699-48812370E32D7BA2&USID=10684&RID=9862281&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DSVCmail%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_view%26mode%3D1%26iinboxid%3D1835507%26iDomainId%3D11%26iObjId%3D10684%26iRecipientAliasId%3D12%26cur_ialiasid%3D12%26cur_vaalias%3DLKK_HQ%26assocdomain%3D1%26assocobj%3D982844%26assocobj2%3D353767%26urlback%3D%252Fclaims%252Findex%252Ecfm%253Ffusebox%253DMTRadjuster%2526fuseaction%253Ddsp%255Fclmheader%2526caseid%253D982844%2526extid%253D353767%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=85501853&CFTOKEN=944583d2d43bc5eb-C6BB95CF-0895-7699-48812370E32D7BA2&USID=10684&RID=9862281

	bfadf7c31deb3e739307194a9263ce3dea2c7f031d700bcf6b99181d3208ad28.pdf
	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style
	c9fdba97a87a854ae038a7e8857b3ca8536263b53d999445ebbc7c422336ada3.pdf
	0f96731171a38b99399e7ed7fdc59e2852d8c219fd644dfa65a1d85e426dc789.pdf

	Microsoft Word - AIG DV (GLOBAL SUM)

	acb8684bfced95b1163093130a69a5fb5cd97e8097e9d12ef5bfe0b7b971ccaf.pdf
	bfadf7c31deb3e739307194a9263ce3dea2c7f031d700bcf6b99181d3208ad28.pdf
	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style
	f8565c4d5959cc40c925ec109ba947d1dd10c0b218e74f591195bfeb42c6533c.pdf


