Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 18 March 2021 10:46 AM
To: Sam San Joi UBI; SUR

Subject: RE: finalize SMG7950X

Dear Sam,

WITHOUT PREJUDUCE

Confirmed $3121.68 before GST @ 3 days

Final invoice and all supporting documents send directly to CHINA TAIPING, their ref: SNM21D200184/C02

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sam San Joi UBI <SanJoi.Sam@borneomotors.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 17 March 2021 1:34 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: finalize SMG7950X

Dear Veron,
Fyi.

Regards
Sam



