Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 12 January 2021 11:44 AM

To: assignments

Cc: ONG LI LI; MT_Claim_SG; SUR

Subject: FW: 2ND OPINION Our Ref: 21916 [External General]
Attachments: SLA1587A SURVEY.pdf; 21916.zip

Dear Li Li

Will assign this review to one of our senior surveyor who specializes in Audi vehicles and have surveyed
many cases at Premium Automobiles.

Dear Assignment Team
Can you ask Adrian to review. Password for the attached docs is 1587.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 12 January 2021 11:30 AM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: 2ND OPINION Our Ref: 21916 [External General]

Lonpac External - General

Dear Bryan

We would like to seek your opinion on the TP’s cost of repairs.
Attached are the following:-

1) Survey report and photographs
2) TP & Our Insured’s GIA report
3) TP LOD

We look forward to hearing from you.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706



The all TN |[onpac.com.sg

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.



