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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 9 February 2021 5:08 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Jojo Cheng; Lauro Araos Songcuan JR; Andre Chow En De; Admin A
Subject: SLV7040E, claim TP AIG SKU6207R, DOA: 12.01.2021
Attachments: [Untitled].pdf

Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
Our customer, SLV7040E holds your insured driver, SKU6207R, liable for the accident dated 
12/01/2021, and would like to claim against your insured driver. 
 
Our customer's claim is for : 
 
Cost of Repair:   $ 8,654.59 
Loss Of Rental:   $ 1,070.00 ($107 per day for 10 days) 
GIA Fee     :     $     2.00 
                        ------------- 
Total Claim             $ 9,726.59  
                        ------------- 
 
If you minded to reach an amicable settlement with our customer, please let us have your 
substantive reply by 23/03/2021. Otherwise our customer will proceed in a manner that he 
deems fit.  
  
 
Best Regards, 
 
Loi Ai Ting 
 
 

 
 
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
T: +65 6568 4556  •  F: +65 6565 1240  •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
 

 
 
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the 
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended 
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is 
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and 
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily 
the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.  













No. RRA21010077
Date: 20 Jan 2021

RENTAL AGREEMENT

The Hirer (as identified below) wishes to lease from Cycle & Carriage Leasing Pte. Ltd. (UEN:
201900307R), a company incorporated in Singapore with its registered office at 239 Alexandra Road,
Singapore 159930 (“Owner”), and the Owner has agreed to lease to the Hirer, the Vehicle (as identified
below), subject to the terms and conditions set out below and in the attached Terms and Conditions of
Rental.
Hirer Particulars Vehicle Particulars
Name : Chai Yi Ann, Louis C/O

Cycle & Carriage Kia Pte Ltd
NRIC/FIN/PP/ROC No. : *****062E
Registered Address : - Singapore -
Mobile No. : +6582990192
Email address : Chailouis@hotmail.com

Vehicle No. : SMQ7173U
Vehicle Type : Kia Cerato L
Vehicle Model : CERATO 1.6(A) LX
Commencement Date : 20/01/2021 16:45
End Date : 03/02/2021 16:45

Driver Particulars Rental Charge
Name : Chai Yi Ann, Louis C/O

Cycle & Carriage Kia Pte Ltd
Driving License No. :
Issue Date : 12/11/1992
Mobile No. : +6582990192

Daily: 14 days x 100.00 $ 1,400.00
Weekly $ 0.00
Monthly $ 0.00
Total $ 1,498.00
Inclusive GST 7.0% $ 98.00
Amt Before GST $ 1,400.00
Deposit Amount $ 0.00

REMARKS Insurance Excess
Section I - $1500/ Section II - $1500
For drivers below age 22, or below 2 years driving
experience, additional excess of $3500 applies

 
☑ I wish to receive the latest news and promotions from Jardine Cycle & Carriage Limited. I consent to the

collection, use and disclosure of my Personal Information by Jardine Cycle & Carriage Limited and its
subsidiaries and affiliates (“JCCL”), in accordance with Clause 14.2 of the Terms and Conditions of Rental.

 
The Owner The Hirer
    

For and on behalf of
Cycle & Carriage Leasing Pte. Ltd.
Name Name : Chai Yi Ann, Louis C/O Cycle & Carriage Kia

Pte Ltd
Designation Company Stamp (if applicable)
Date Date
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 Our Ref: CC4/AIG21000616/Egs3  
 
15 JANUARY 2021 
 
KWEK HIANG HWEE 
58 RIPLEY CRESCENT 
SINGAPORE 556234 
DRIVER: KWEK JIT FONG 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKU 6207R & SLV 7040E ON 12/01/2021 

We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster 
Company by your Motor Insurer (AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.) to resolve the 
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up 
with them. 
 
This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from SLV 7040E. 
  
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will 
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and 
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. 
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this 
claim and your NCD will be protected. 
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
Yours faithfully, 

 
Cecilia Chong 
Case Handler 
DID: 6749 4274 
FAX: 6741 4108 
EMAIL: ceciliachong@lkkauto.com 
 
c.c   AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd       
           (Motor Claims Dept) 
 




