9/21/21, 5:18 PM Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: LOD for SKS 7465 R ; Your Insured: SKQ 4451 K ; DOA: 10/01/2021// LKK REF:
CC4/ASM21000566/T1pa3

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Tue 21/9/2021 5:13 PM

To: Settlement <settlement.rico60@gmail.com>
Cc: 'Damian Lim' <enquiry@rico60.com>; 'Rico 60" <claims@rico60.com>

[ﬂJ 1 attachments (512 KB)
DS FORM_SKS7465R.pdf;

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your acceptance.

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Settlement <settlement.rico60@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 21 September 2021 12:03 pm

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Damian Lim' <enquiry@rico60.com>; 'Rico 60' <claims@rico60.com>

Subject: RE: LOD for SKS 7465 R ; Your Insured: SKQ 4451 K ; DOA: 10/01/2021// LKK REF:
CC4/ASM21000566/T1pa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Thank you for your email.

Offer accepted, kindly send us the DV & release payment.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Prescelia Hoe
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RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: settlement.rico60@gmail.com

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, September 21, 2021 10:09 AM

To: 'Settlement’' <settlement.rico60@gmail.com>

Cc: Damian Lim <enquiry@rico60.com>; Rico 60 <claims@rico60.com>

Subject: RE: LOD for SKS 7465 R ; Your Insured: SKQ 4451 K ; DOA: 10/01/2021// LKK REF:
CC4/ASM21000566/T1pa3

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: OH Vale <vale.oh@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 20 September 2021 12:46 pm

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Enquiry <settlement.rico60@gmail.com>

Subject: FW: RE: LOD for SKS 7465 R ; Your Insured: SKQ 4451 K ; DOA: 10/01/2021

Hi Hsiao Tong
Refer to the above.
LOD has been shared via SC, please reply to TP, tks.

Best Regards
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Vale Oh/A.Manager — Motor Claims
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd/ 8§ Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811/www.axa.com.sg

vale.oh(@axa.com.sg
Customer Care No. 1800 8804888

Please consider the environment before printing this message

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for
in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole
or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender
immediately.

From: Roman De Alban <cst(@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, September 18, 2021 12:02 PM

To: OH Vale <vale.oh@axa.com.sg>

Cc: SG AXA Insurance SM Motor Doc <motor.doc(@axa.com.sg>

Subject: FW: RE: LOD for SKS 7465 R ; Your Insured: SKQ 4451 K ; DOA: 10/01/2021

Dear Vale

For Claim no. SIM030C4, 3rd Party Workshop, RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD., chasing for claim
offer/settlement.

For your file record and necessary action.
With regards

Roman De Alban | Specialist, GI Call Centre AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower,
Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg

Email: cst@axa.com.sg

Phone: 1800 880 4888 (Within Singapore) / (65) 6880 4888 (International)

--------------- Original Message ---------------

From: Settlement [settlement.rico60@gmail.com]|

Sent: 15/09/2021 17:22

To: cst@axa.com.sg

Cc: enquiry(@rico60.com; claims@rico60.com

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: LOD for SKS 7465 R ; Your Insured: SKQ 4451 K ; DOA: 10/01/2021

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Motor Claims Department,

Please advise if you have any updates for the above case?
Thank you

Best Regards,

Yvonne Teoh
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From: Claims [mailto:claims@rico60.com]|

Sent: Thursday, 26 August 2021 12:58 PM

To: 'CST'

Cc: 'Settlement'; 'Rico 60 Enquiry'

Subject: LOD for SKS 7465 R ; Your Insured: SKQ 4451 K ; DOA: 10/01/2021

Dear Motor Claims Dept,

Your Insured : SKQ 4451 K

Attached file as per your pursuant

Kindly release DV/Settlement offer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Prescelia Hoe

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier (@ Kaki Bukit #02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060

Email: settlement.rico60@gmail.com <mailto:settlement.rico60@gmail.com>

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for
in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole
or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender
immediately.

ref: 00DbOKylf. 5002v2zjGfi:ref

----- Disclaimer-----

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you
are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If
you have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions
presented in this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA
Insurance Pte Ltd or any other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly
authorized by the said companies.

----- Disclaimer-----
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This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you
are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If
you have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions
presented in this message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA
Insurance Pte Ltd or any other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly
authorized by the said companies.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by

AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is

prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify

the sender immediately.
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