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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Team AutoPro <tap.finalization@gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 24 April 2021 3:07 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: Re: 2 DAYS NOTICE : SLR 9227 S (Our Ref) and GBH 6410 U (Your Ref) Dated 26TH 

DECEMBER 2020

Dear All , 

 

Without Prejudice 

   

Thank You for your prompt reply. 

 

We are pleased to confirm our acceptance to your proposed COR @ $2800 & 05 Repair Days. 

 

Kindly advise OIC and reference number (if any) for our submission of LOD.(Ignore if already mentioned in the reply.) 

 

Enclosed herewith after-repair photos fyn. 

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall 

not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal 

injuries.* 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
Cheers, 
John Ko 
Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 
HP : 6258 1955 
Fax: 6258 1956 

 

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

 

 

On Fri, Apr 23, 2021 at 10:24 AM Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear John, 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Offer Lump Sum $2,800.00 and 5 repair days. 

  

Kindly check and confirm. 

  

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>  

Sent: Friday, 8 January 2021 3:06 PM 

To: China Taiping - 2 Days <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chong 

Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong.Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh 

<alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com> 

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: 2 DAYS NOTICE : SLR 9227 S (Our Ref) and GBH 6410 U (Your Ref) Dated 26TH DECEMBER 2020 

  

Dear Sir/Madam,  

Road Traffic Accident Involving SLR 9227 S (Our Ref) and GBH 6410 U (Your Ref) 

Dated 26TH DECEMBER 2020, Time around 2000HRS 

@ ALONG WOODLANDS AVE 5 

  

  

We represent our client; TOH GUO ZONG, to notify you of the aforesaid road traffic accident involving our client‘s 

vehicle registration number: SLR 9227 S and your insured’s vehicle registration number: GBH 6410 U.   

  

For efficiency purpose, we are agreeable with the appointment of LKK AUTOCONSULTANTS as 

the SJE for subject claim.   
Please let us know within 2 working days from today your agreeing to the above otherwise kindly send us your list of at 

least ten (10) motor surveyors, via email to the following personnel:-   

  
  

Contact Person Eric Lee 8269 9999 

    

Email Address teamautopl@gmail.com 

Survey Address 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity   Singapore 575722    
  
Thank you for your attention to this email and we look forward to your earliest reply. 
  

  

Cheers, 

Peach Ang 

--  
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*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall 

not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his 

personal injuries.* 

------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  

Note: Dear all, do note that Team AutoPro will be subjected to GST filing within the next 2 
months. We would appreciate your kind prioritization on pending cases to avoid revision on final 
payment. Thank you and do let us know if you have further query.  

       

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 

 

   Tel: 6258 1955 Fax: 6258 1956 

  

              

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 


