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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 31 March 2021 9:50 AM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: FW: SGU8383U GIA and Video

Follow Up Flag: Flag for follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

  

From: Xin Yun Auto <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, 31 March 2021 9:49:50 AM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: FW: SGU8383U GIA and Video 

Dear Rasul agreed to proceed.  

 

Thank you and best regards, 

Yi Xin 

 

 
Xin Yun Auto 
Tel/Fax:6634 0858 
Mobile: 9839 1555 
Email:xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

 

 

On Wed, Mar 31, 2021 at 9:12 AM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Yi Xin, 

  

Any update? 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 16 March, 2021 2:44 PM 

To: Xin Yun Auto 
Subject: RE: SGU8383U GIA and Video 

  

Hi Yi Xin, 

  

Refer to attachment 

  

As spoken, I’ve revised the estimate.  

  

  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 

related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 16 March, 2021 11:14 AM 
To: Xin Yun Auto 
Subject: RE: SGU8383U GIA and Video 

  

Hi Yi Xin, 

  

Refer to attachment 

Finalised amount is $ 9,700 / 10 days of lump sum repair 

Kindly confirm 

  

  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 

related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

From: Xin Yun Auto [mailto:xinyunauto1@gmail.com]  
Sent: Friday, 5 March, 2021 2:29 PM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: SGU8383U GIA and Video 
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Dear Rasul, 

  

Good afternoon, can i follow up on SGU8383U marking, sorry to ask again, i know you are busy, please help me for this, 

thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto 

Tel/Fax:6634 0858 

Mobile: 9839 1555 

Email:xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

  

  

On Wed, Jan 20, 2021 at 12:06 PM Xin Yun Auto <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Rasul, 

  

Good afternoon, please refer to SGQ8383U final pictures for your reference, thanks. 

  

The behind boot-spare tyre cover /pls take a note 

This vehicle is PI vehicle, body pares all aluminum, for this boot cover-spare tyre cover was dent and crack. 

Local agent's spare tyre cover shape abit different, we replaced order from Japan, due to the current Covid situation, 

may take longer time to reach. 

Once the part arrives, we will ask client to come over to replace it, thanks alot. 

  

Thanks Rasul, 

Best Regards, 

Yi Xin 
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Xin Yun Auto 

Tel/Fax:6634 0858 

Mobile: 9839 1555 

Email:xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

  

  

On Thu, Jan 14, 2021 at 12:10 PM Xin Yun Auto <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Rasul, 

  

Good morning, before-paint pictures for you, fyi...thanks alot. 

  

Best Regards, 

Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto 

Tel/Fax:6634 0858 

Mobile: 9839 1555 

Email:xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

  

  

 

Virus-free. www.avast.com  

  

On Tue, Jan 12, 2021 at 3:54 PM Xin Yun Auto <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Rasul, 

  

Good afternoon, fyi...estimate for your marking, thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto 

Tel/Fax:6634 0858 

Mobile: 9839 1555 

Email:xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

  

  

On Sat, Jan 9, 2021 at 2:46 PM Xin Yun Auto <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Rasul, fyi...SGU8383U GIA and video for your reference, thank you. 

 SGQ8383U GIA.pdf 

 VID-20210107-WA0092.mp4 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto 

Tel/Fax:6634 0858 

Mobile: 9839 1555 

Email:xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

  

 

Virus-free. www.avast.com  

  


