Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 7 January 2021 6:39 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com; 'SUR'

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving YM7386B, GBB9603S (Ol) & SJD4390H
on 03 January 2021 - Oref: 20/21/21/VC00/024086 [External Confidential]

Attachments: 2021.01.05 1st Notice of Accident to Lonpac Insurance Bhd.pdf; Insd GIA.pdf

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear team
Please arrange for a PRS on t/p vehicle YM7386B at:

MK Vehicle Engineering Pte Ltd

48 Toh Guan Road East

#04-124, Enterprise Hub

Singapore 608586

Please contact 6763 6363 to arrange the PRI.

Attached herewith Insd’s GIA report for your perusal.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Kenny Lim

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all TN |[onpac.com.sg

Experience It Mow

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: AXIS LAW CORPORATION <enquiries.axislaw@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 7 January 2021 6:30 pm

To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: Alina Sim <alina@axislaw.com.sg>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT AT CTE TOWARDS TOWN BETWEEN VEHICLES YM7386B, GBB9603S & SJD4390H ON 03
January 2021 AT ABOUT 15:00 PM JS/21/01431 [External Confidential]

Dear Kenny,

The vehicle is currently at:



MK Vehicle Engineering Pte Ltd
48 Toh Guan Road East
#04-124, Enterprise Hub
Singapore 608586

Please contact 6763 6363 to arrange the PRI.

Regards,

Andrew (Trainee)

For Alina Sim

AXIS LAW CORPORATION

163 Tras Street

#06-04

Singapore 079024

Advocates & Solicitors

Commissioners For Oaths

Notaries Public

Tel :6535 6850

Fax : 6532 3490

Email : enquiries.axislaw@gmail.com
: enquiry@axislaw.com.sg

Website : www.axislaw.com.sg

NOTICE : This email may be privileged from disclosure and is for the
intended recipient. If you have received this in error, please notify us, do
not disseminate the message and delete it from your computer.

Thank you.

NOTE : There have been cases where false emails were sent out purportedly by Law Entities to request for payment.

To prevent fraud from occurring, we would be very grateful if you could make a telephone call to our office at 65
6535 6850 to confirm that the email was from us before sending any payment or deposit. Thank you.

On Thu, 7 Jan 2021 at 15:25, KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com> wrote:

Lonpac External - Confidential

Without Prejudice

Save as to Costs

Dear Berlina

We refer to our email below and appreciate your reply soon.



Thank you.

Best Regards

Kenny Lim
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all ©Hew" lonpac.com.sg

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE

Sent: Wednesday, 6 January 2021 4:27 pm

To: 'AXIS LAW CORPORATION' <enquiries.axislaw@gmail.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Cc: Alina Sim <alina@axislaw.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT AT CTE TOWARDS TOWN BETWEEN VEHICLES YM7386B, GBB9603S & SJD4390H ON 03
January 2021 AT ABOUT 15:00 PM JS/21/01431 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential

Without Prejudice

Save as to Costs

Dear Berlina



We are not agreeable to your list of surveyors and will proceed to appint LKK Auto
Consultants for the PRS.

Please let us have the details of the survey.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Kenny Lim

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all TN |[onpac.com.sg

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: AXIS LAW CORPORATION

Sent: Wednesday, 6 January 2021 3:40 pm

To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE ; MT_Claim_SG

Cc: Alina Sim

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT AT CTE TOWARDS TOWN BETWEEN VEHICLES YM7386B, GBB9603S & SJD4390H ON 03
January 2021 AT ABOUT 15:00 PM JS/21/01431 [External Confidential]

Dear Kenny,



Please see letter attached list of surveyors,
Regards,
Berlina (Paralegal)

For Alina Sim
AXIS LAW CORPORATION

163 Tras Street

#06-04

Singapore 079024

Advocates & Solicitors
Commissioners For Oaths

Notaries Public

Tel : 6535 6850

Fax : 6532 3490

Email : enquiries.axislaw@gmail.com
: enquiry@axislaw.com.sg

Website : www.axislaw.com.sg

NOTICE : This email may be privileged from disclosure and is for the
intended recipient. If you have received this in error, please notify us, do
not disseminate the message and delete it from your computer.

Thank you.

NOTE : There have been cases where false emails were sent out purportedly by Law Entities to request for
payment. To prevent fraud from occurring, we would be very grateful if you could make a telephone call to our
office at 65 6535 6850 to confirm that the email was from us before sending any payment or deposit. Thank you.

On Wed, 6 Jan 2021 at 12:18, KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@Ilonpac.com> wrote:

Lonpac External - Confidential

Without Prejudice

Save as to Costs

Dear Berlina




Oref: 20/21/21/VC00/024086

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle and append below our list
of Motor surveyors for your attention:-

Nicholas Tey-Appraisal
Jackson Quek - Appraisal
Joshua Ong - Appraisal
Steve Chen- LKK

Adrian Ling - LKK
Kenneth Kong - LKK
Qing Quo Xiang- LKK

Oi Sun Pin - LKK

Mohd Rasul -LKK

Marcus Chua - LKK

OlV|VIN|O|UN|AP|IWIN|-

[

Please let us hear from you soon.

Best Regards

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: AXIS LAW CORPORATION <enquiries.axislaw @gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 6 January 2021 11:06 am

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT AT CTE TOWARDS TOWN BETWEEN VEHICLES YM7386B, GBB9603S & SID4390H ON 03 January
2021 AT ABOUT 15:00 PM JS/21/01431

Dear Sir and Mesdames,

Please see attached letter of Notice of accident. Please within or before 2 working days.

[x] -

IGIA_YM7386B.pdf




Regards,
Berlina (Paralegal)

For Alina Sim
AXIS LAW CORPORATION

163 Tras Street

#06-04

Singapore 079024

Advocates & Solicitors
Commissioners For Oaths

Notaries Public

Tel : 6535 6850

Fax : 6532 3490

Email : enquiries.axislaw@gmail.com
: enquiry@axislaw.com.sg

Website : www.axislaw.com.sg

NOTICE : This email may be privileged from disclosure and is for the
intended recipient. If you have received this in error, please notify us, do
not disseminate the message and delete it from your computer.

Thank you.

NOTE : There have been cases where false emails were sent out purportedly by Law Entities to request for
payment. To prevent fraud from occurring, we would be very grateful if you could make a telephone call to our
office at 65 6535 6850 to confirm that the email was from us before sending any payment or deposit. Thank you.



