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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Khar Kian Toh <tohkk_90@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 5 January 2021 10:28 AM

To: admin; 'assignments'; 'Admin A'; 'CS A Team'

Subject: RE: Accident involved with vehicle SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) 

on 22/12/2020 1700HRS ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 

1

Attachments: SMF9600Z_22122020.pdf; receipt-20210105-100439.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam 

 We would like to do a Direct Settlement with you if our liability is 100%. 

 Kindly advise us on the liability and arrange for survey. 

The above attachment is the GIA Report and  LTA search ,  

Vehicle currently Not in workshop. Any suitable slot for coming Thursday Morning 10am- 1pm? 

Thanks 

 
Best Regards, 
Toh Khar Kian 

 
Li Sheng Automobile Trading 
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K) 
Mobile: (65) 83987469 l Fax: 67744885 
Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com 

 

 

 

From: Khar Kian Toh  

Sent: Monday, 23 March, 2020 12:51 PM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident involved with vehicle GBD7642G (OUR INSURED) and GBG626J (TP) on20/03/2020 1030HRS 

ALONG TPE TOWARDS WOODLANDS 

 

Dear Sir/Madam 

 We would like to do a Direct Settlement with you if our liability is 100%. 

 Kindly advise us on the liability and arrange for survey. 

The above attachment is the GIA Report and  LTA search ,  

Vehicle currently in workshop.  

Thanks 
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Best Regards, 
Toh Khar Kian 

 
Li Sheng Automobile Trading 
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K) 
Mobile: (65) 83987469 l Fax: 67744885 
Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com 
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