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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Khar Kian Toh <tohkk_90@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 5 May 2021 10:17 AM

To: SUR; Admin A

Cc: Joel Goh

Subject: RE: EQI Ref: DM21HO00031 / JG: SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 

22/12/2020 1700HRS ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1

Attachments: SMF9600Z INVOICE LOD LOA LTA SEARCH.pdf

Kindly acknowledge above attachment is our Tax invoice, LOD, LOA , and LTA Search Fee, 
 

Breakdown: 
                                                                                                                               Amount($) 

1) Repair cost                                                                                                        $1200.00 

2) Loss of Use (3days + 1 Sunday =$120 x 4 days)                                             $480.00 

3) Miscellaneous (LTA Search Fee)                                                                      $7.45 

                                                                                                                                    
                                                                                                     Total                  $1687.45  
 
Best Regards, 
Toh Khar Kian 

 
Li Sheng Automobile Trading 
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K) 
Mobile: (65) 83987469 l Fax: 67744885 
Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com 

 

 

From: Joel Goh [mailto:joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg]  
Sent: Monday, 3 May, 2021 3:15 PM 
To: 'Khar Kian Toh' <tohkk_90@hotmail.com> 
Subject: RE: EQI Ref: DM21HO00031 / JG: SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 
22/12/2020 1700HRS ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

 

Without Prejudice 

Save As To Cost 

 

Dear Khar Kian 

 

We welcome direct settlement for this case. 
 
Announcement 

 

In line with the Safe Re-opening measures, our operation remains “Business As Usual” – except most of us are on a Work-From-Home arrangement -reachable by phone or email. 

 

Our Customer Care Counter will remain closed until further notice. Any onsite customer care service, including meetings in the EQI premises can only be conducted on a prior agreed appointment basis.

 

Best Regards,  

Joel Goh  

Senior Executive | Claims 
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EQ Insurance Company Limited  
 

5 Maxwell Road  #17-00  Tower Block  MND Complex  Singapore 069110  

did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190 

www.eqinsurance.com.sg         
  

   
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.
 

 

 

From: Khar Kian Toh <tohkk_90@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 29 April 2021 10:01 AM 
To: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: EQI Ref: DM21HO00031 / JG: SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 
22/12/2020 1700HRS ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

 

Dear Joel, 
 

Any update of this case? It is our insured reported this accident already? 

 

Thanks. 
 

 
Best Regards, 
Toh Khar Kian 

 
Li Sheng Automobile Trading 
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K) 
Mobile: (65) 83987469 l Fax: 67744885 
Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com 

 

 

 

From: Joel Goh [mailto:joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg]  
Sent: Monday, 15 March, 2021 3:18 PM 
To: 'Khar Kian Toh' <tohkk_90@hotmail.com> 
Subject: RE: EQI Ref: DM21HO00031 / JG: SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 
22/12/2020 1700HRS ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

 

Without Prejudice 

Save As To Cost 

 

Dear Khar Kian 

  

Our insured has not reported this accident. 

 
Announcement 

 

In line with the Safe Re-opening measures, our operation remains “Business As Usual” – except most of us are on a Work-From-Home arrangement -reachable by phone or email. 
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Our Customer Care Counter will remain closed until further notice. Any onsite customer care service, including meetings in the EQI premises can only be conducted on a prior agreed appointment basis.

 

Best Regards,  

Joel Goh  

Senior Executive | Claims 

  

   
EQ Insurance Company Limited  
 

5 Maxwell Road  #17-00  Tower Block  MND Complex  Singapore 069110  

did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190 

www.eqinsurance.com.sg         
  

   
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.
 

 

 

From: Khar Kian Toh <tohkk_90@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, 15 March 2021 1:37 PM 
To: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: EQI Ref: DM21HO00031 / JG: SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 
22/12/2020 1700HRS ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

 

Dear Joel,  
 

Did your insured submit accident report?  
 

Kindly advise.  
 

Thanks 

 

Toh.  
 

Get Outlook for Android 

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg> 
Sent: Wednesday, February 24, 2021 10:21:54 AM 
To: 'tohkk_90@hotmail.com' <tohkk_90@hotmail.com> 
Subject: RE: EQI Ref: DM21HO00031 / JG: SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 
22/12/2020 1700HRS ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1  
  
Without Prejudice 

Save As To Cost 

 

Dear Khar Kian 

  

Our insured has not reported this accident. 

We will revert to you once we have received our insured’s accident report. 

  
Announcement 
  
In line with the Safe Re-opening measures, our operation remains “Business As Usual” – except most of us are on a Work-From-Home arrangement -reachable by phone or email. 
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Our Customer Care Counter will remain closed until further notice. Any onsite customer care service, including meetings in the EQI premises can only be conducted on a prior agreed appointment basis.

  

Best Regards,  

Joel Goh  

Senior Executive | Claims 

  

 

  

EQ Insurance Company Limited  
 

5 Maxwell Road  #17-00  Tower Block  MND Complex  Singapore 069110  

did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190 

www.eqinsurance.com.sg         

  

 

  

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.
 

  

  

From: Khar Kian Toh [mailto:tohkk_90@hotmail.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 24 February 2021 10:07 AM 

To: Janice Goh <janice.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg> 

Cc: Steve Lim <steve.lim@eqinsurance.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: EQI Ref: DM21HO00031 / JG: SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 22/12/2020 1700HRS 

ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

  

Dear All, 

  

Any update on the liability for this case. 

  

It is your insured make the accident report? 

  

Kindly advise. 

  

Thanks. 

  

  
Best Regards, 
Toh Khar Kian 

 
Li Sheng Automobile Trading 
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K) 
Mobile: (65) 83987469 l Fax: 67744885 
Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com 

  

  

  

From: Khar Kian Toh  

Sent: Tuesday, 16 February, 2021 2:38 PM 
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To: Janice Goh <janice.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg> 

Cc: Steve Lim <steve.lim@eqinsurance.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: EQI Ref: DM21HO00031 / JG: SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 22/12/2020 1700HRS 

ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

  

Dear Janice, 

  

Kindly acknowledge attachment of Police Investigate Result. 

  

Thanks. 

  

  
Best Regards, 
Toh Khar Kian 

 
Li Sheng Automobile Trading 
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K) 
Mobile: (65) 83987469 l Fax: 67744885 
Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com 

  

  

  

From: Janice Goh [mailto:janice.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 16 February, 2021 12:59 PM 

To: tohkk_90@hotmail.com 

Cc: Steve Lim <steve.lim@eqinsurance.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: EQI Ref: DM21HO00031 / JG: SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 22/12/2020 1700HRS 

ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Mr Toh 

  

Our insured still has not reported the accident to us yet. 

  

Thank you.  

  

  
Announcement 
  
In line with the Safe Re-opening measures, our operation remains “Business As Usual” – except most of us are on a Work-From-Home arrangement -reachable by phone or 

  
Our Customer Care Counter will remain closed until further notice. Any onsite customer care service, including meetings in the EQI premises can only be conducted on a prior agreed appointment basis.

  

Regards  

  

Janice Goh 

Executive | Claims  

  

 

  
EQ Insurance Company Limited  
 

5 Maxwell Road  #17-00  Tower Block  MND Complex  Singapore 069110  
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did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190 

          

www.eqinsurance.com.sg         
  

 

  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.        
 

  

From: Khar Kian Toh [mailto:tohkk_90@hotmail.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 16 February 2021 10:29 AM 

To: Steve Lim <steve.lim@eqinsurance.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: EQI Ref: DM21HO00031 / JG: SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 22/12/2020 1700HRS 

ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

  

Dear Steve, 

  

Any update for this case? 

  

It is your client submitted accident report? 

  

  
Best Regards, 
Toh Khar Kian 

 
Li Sheng Automobile Trading 
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K) 
Mobile: (65) 83987469 l Fax: 67744885 
Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com 

  

  

  

From: Khar Kian Toh  

Sent: Monday, 8 February, 2021 4:14 PM 

To: Steve Lim <steve.lim@eqinsurance.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: EQI Ref: DM21HO00031 / JG: SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 22/12/2020 1700HRS 

ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

  

Dear Steve, 

  

It is your client do the accident reporting? 

  

Kindly advise. 

  

Thanks. 

  

  
Best Regards, 
Toh Khar Kian 

 
Li Sheng Automobile Trading 
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K) 
Mobile: (65) 83987469 l Fax: 67744885 
Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com 
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From: Steve Lim [mailto:steve.lim@eqinsurance.com.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 26 January, 2021 1:16 PM 

To: Khar Kian Toh <tohkk_90@hotmail.com> 

Subject: RE: EQI Ref: DM21HO00031 / JG: SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 22/12/2020 1700HRS 

ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Sirs, 

  

Accident still not reported. You may check again in a week time as we are following up with our insured 

  
Announcement 
  
In line with the Safe Re-opening measures, our operation remains “Business As Usual” – except most of us are on a Work-From-Home 

arrangement -reachable by phone or email or an arranged video call meeting.  
  

Our Customer Care Counter will remain closed until further notice. Any onsite customer care service, including meetings in the EQI premises 

can only be conducted on a prior agreed appointment basis. 

  

Regards,  

 

Steve Lim  

Assistant Manager | Claims 

  

  
EQ Insurance Company Limited  
 

5 Maxwell Road  #17-00  Tower Block  MND Complex  Singapore 069110  

          

did 65 6496 9885 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 885 | fax 65 6223 4190 
www.eqinsurance.com.sg         
  

 

  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.        
 

  

  

From: Khar Kian Toh [mailto:tohkk_90@hotmail.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 26 January 2021 1:11 PM 

To: Steve Lim <steve.lim@eqinsurance.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: EQI Ref: DM21HO00031 / JG: SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 22/12/2020 1700HRS 

ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

  

Dear Steve, 

  

Any update for this accident case. 

  

Our insured reported? 

  

Kindly advise. 

  

Thanks. 
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Best Regards, 
Toh Khar Kian 

 
Li Sheng Automobile Trading 
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K) 
Mobile: (65) 83987469 l Fax: 67744885 
Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com 

  

  

  

  

From: Steve Lim [mailto:steve.lim@eqinsurance.com.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 19 January, 2021 9:36 AM 

To: Khar Kian Toh <tohkk_90@hotmail.com> 

Subject: EQI Ref: DM21HO00031 / JG: SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 22/12/2020 1700HRS 

ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

Our insured has not reported the accident to us, hence we unable to advise on liability. We are following up with our 

insured on same.  

  
Announcement 
  
In line with the Safe Re-opening measures, our operation remains “Business As Usual” – except most of us are on a Work-From-Home 

arrangement -reachable by phone or email or an arranged video call meeting.  
  

Our Customer Care Counter will remain closed until further notice. Any onsite customer care service, including meetings in the EQI premises 

can only be conducted on a prior agreed appointment basis. 

  

Regards,  

 

Steve Lim  

Assistant Manager | Claims 

  

  
EQ Insurance Company Limited  
 

5 Maxwell Road  #17-00  Tower Block  MND Complex  Singapore 069110  

          

did 65 6496 9885 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 885 | fax 65 6223 4190 
www.eqinsurance.com.sg         
  

 

  
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.        
 

  

  

From: Khar Kian Toh [mailto:tohkk_90@hotmail.com]  

Sent: Monday, 18 January 2021 5:42 PM 

To: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg>; EQI PRS <EQIPRS@eqinsurance.com.sg> 
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Subject: RE: Accident involved with vehicle SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 22/12/2020 1700HRS 

ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

  

Dear All, 

  

Would like to check liability for this case. 

  

Kindly advise. 

  

Thanks. 

  
Best Regards, 
Toh Khar Kian 

 
Li Sheng Automobile Trading 
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K) 
Mobile: (65) 83987469 l Fax: 67744885 
Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com 

  

  

From: Khar Kian Toh  

Sent: Monday, 18 January, 2021 5:39 PM 

To: joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg 

Subject: RE: Accident involved with vehicle SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 22/12/2020 1700HRS 

ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

  

Dear Joel, 

  

Would like to check liability for this case. 

  

Kindly advise. 

  

Thanks. 

  
Best Regards, 
Toh Khar Kian 

 
Li Sheng Automobile Trading 
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K) 
Mobile: (65) 83987469 l Fax: 67744885 
Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com 

  

  

  

From: Khar Kian Toh <tohkk_90@hotmail.com>  

Sent: Monday, 18 January 2021 5:30 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident involved with vehicle SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 22/12/2020 1700HRS 

ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

  

Hi Veron, 
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Can send me Joel Email address so I can check with him. 

  

  
Best Regards, 
Toh Khar Kian 

 
Li Sheng Automobile Trading 
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K) 
Mobile: (65) 83987469 l Fax: 67744885 
Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com 

  

  

  

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 13 January, 2021 5:05 PM 

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; 'Khar Kian Toh' <tohkk_90@hotmail.com>; assignments 

<assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident involved with vehicle SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 22/12/2020 1700HRS 

ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

  

Dear Khar Kian, 
  
  
Please refer to Joel for liability. 
  
  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 13 January 2021 4:11 PM 

To: 'Khar Kian Toh' <tohkk_90@hotmail.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident involved with vehicle SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 22/12/2020 1700HRS 

ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

  

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

  

Thank you for the email. 

  

Dear Veron, 

  

Kindly assist 

  

FYNA Our Ref : CC3/EQI21000321/R1vd3 
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BEST REGARDS 

G.NIVITHA 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
  
  

* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 

  

From: Khar Kian Toh <tohkk_90@hotmail.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 13 January 2021 4:02 PM 

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>; 'CS A Team' <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident involved with vehicle SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 22/12/2020 1700HRS 

ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

  

Dear All,  

  

Who can I check liability for this case? 

  

Kindly advise. 

  

Thanks. 

  

  
Best Regards, 
Toh Khar Kian 

 
Li Sheng Automobile Trading 
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K) 
Mobile: (65) 83987469 l Fax: 67744885 
Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com 

  

  

  

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 7 January, 2021 1:54 PM 

To: 'Khar Kian Toh' <tohkk_90@hotmail.com>; 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>; 'CS A Team' <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident involved with vehicle SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 22/12/2020 1700HRS 

ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

  

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

  

Apologise will check and revert to you shortly. 
  

  

BEST REGARDS 

G.NIVITHA 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
  
  

* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 

  

From: Khar Kian Toh <tohkk_90@hotmail.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 7 January 2021 12:59 PM 

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>; 'CS A Team' <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident involved with vehicle SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 22/12/2020 1700HRS 

ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

  

Dear All, 

  

Can let me know that who will caming down for survey today? 

  

Until now nobody reach my place for pre survey. 

  

Kindly advise. 

  

Thanks. 

  
Best Regards, 
Toh Khar Kian 

 
Li Sheng Automobile Trading 
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K) 
Mobile: (65) 83987469 l Fax: 67744885 
Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com 

  

  

From: Khar Kian Toh  

Sent: Tuesday, 5 January, 2021 2:38 PM 

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>; 'CS A Team' <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident involved with vehicle SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 22/12/2020 1700HRS 

ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

  

Dear All, 

  

Confirm as date 07/01/2020 @ 10am-1pm for pre survey. 

  

Thanks. 

  

  
Best Regards, 
Toh Khar Kian 
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Li Sheng Automobile Trading 
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K) 
Mobile: (65) 83987469 l Fax: 67744885 
Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com 

  

  

  

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 5 January, 2021 1:57 PM 

To: 'Khar Kian Toh' <tohkk_90@hotmail.com>; 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>; 'CS A Team' <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident involved with vehicle SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 22/12/2020 1700HRS 

ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

  

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

  

Yes you may arrange on 07/01/2021 @ 10am-1pm. 

  
  

  

BEST REGARDS 

G.NIVITHA 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
  
  

* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 

  

From: Khar Kian Toh <tohkk_90@hotmail.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 5 January 2021 10:28 AM 

To: admin <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>; 'CS A Team' <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident involved with vehicle SMF9600Z (OUR INSURED) and GBA1948E (TP) on 22/12/2020 1700HRS 

ALONG NO1 SOON LEE STREET -PIONEER CENTRE -LEVEL 1 

  

Dear Sir/Madam 

 We would like to do a Direct Settlement with you if our liability is 100%. 

 Kindly advise us on the liability and arrange for survey. 

The above attachment is the GIA Report and  LTA search ,  

Vehicle currently Not in workshop. Any suitable slot for coming Thursday Morning 10am- 1pm? 

Thanks 

  
Best Regards, 
Toh Khar Kian 
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Li Sheng Automobile Trading 
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K) 
Mobile: (65) 83987469 l Fax: 67744885 
Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com 

  

  

  

From: Khar Kian Toh  

Sent: Monday, 23 March, 2020 12:51 PM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident involved with vehicle GBD7642G (OUR INSURED) and GBG626J (TP) on20/03/2020 1030HRS 

ALONG TPE TOWARDS WOODLANDS 

  

Dear Sir/Madam 

 We would like to do a Direct Settlement with you if our liability is 100%. 

 Kindly advise us on the liability and arrange for survey. 

The above attachment is the GIA Report and  LTA search ,  

Vehicle currently in workshop.  

Thanks 

  

  
Best Regards, 
Toh Khar Kian 

 
Li Sheng Automobile Trading 
18 Pandan Loop #01-18 Singapore 128236 (Blk K) 
Mobile: (65) 83987469 l Fax: 67744885 
Email : tohkk_90@hotmail.com 

  

  

 

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software. 
www.avg.com  

  

Total Control Panel Login 

 

To: steve.lim@eqinsurance.com.sg Remove this sender from my allow list 
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From: tohkk_90@hotmail.com 
 

 

You received this message because the sender is on your allow list. 
 

  


