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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 6 January 2021 11:02 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto (admin-d@lkkauto.com); SUR; assignments

Cc: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department); chan pick yuen

Subject: RE: SLH9072Z & GX1637Y Doa 3/1/21 ERGO:CDMCG21000013

Data Classification: Confidential, C3 

Hi LKK, 

 

Please conduct this survey request. 

(Note:  Survey vehicle only,  LOD will be handled by Ergo) 

 

Kindly inform us if you are not able to attend it. 

Thank you. 

 

 

Warmest Regards, 

Phoebe Jay Xie 

Manager 

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. 

 

8 Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Three 

Singapore 038988 

DID.:  +65 6829 9191 

phoebe.xie@ergo.com.sg 

 

 
 

Your acceptance of our offer constitutes a binding agreement in the full and final settlement of your claim. By 

clearing our cheque, you are discharging ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd and our insured/s from all further liabilities arising 

directly or indirectly from the said accident. 

 

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 6 January 2021 10:46 am 

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: SLH9072Z & GX1637Y Doa 3/1/21 ERGO:CDMCG21000013 

 

Dear Sir / Mdm , 

 

LKK Auto Consultant. Thanks  

 

Get Outlook for iOS 

From: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg> 

Sent: Wednesday, January 6, 2021 10:26:01 AM 

To: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>; ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) 

<claims@ergo.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: SLH9072Z & GX1637Y Doa 3/1/21 ERGO:CDMCG21000013  
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Data Classification: Confidential, C3 
  

Dear Pick Yuen, 

   

We would like to conduct a PRI survey, please refer to our list of surveyors : 

  

1 AIS Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd 

2 FTA FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd 

3 IAS Infiniti Appraisal Service 

4 JPK JP Knights Pte Ltd 

5 LBS L.B.S Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

6 LKK LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

7 PS Priority Services 

8 VAC Vicom Ltd 

9 AJAX AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd 

  

  

Warmest Regards, 

Phoebe Jay Xie 

Manager 

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. 

  

8 Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Three 

Singapore 038988 

DID.:  +65 6829 9191 

phoebe.xie@ergo.com.sg 

  

 
  

Your acceptance of our offer constitutes a binding agreement in the full and final settlement of your claim. By 

clearing our cheque, you are discharging ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd and our insured/s from all further liabilities arising 

directly or indirectly from the said accident. 

  

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 6 January 2021 10:11 am 

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg> 

Subject: Fwd: SLH9072Z & GX1637Y Doa 3/1/21 

  

  

Dear Sir / Mdm , 

  

Enclosed is our client GiA report.  

Please let us have your 10 name list of surveyor . Thanks  

  

  

Best Regards  

Chris Chan  

Green Forest Automobile Pte Ltd  
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Hp:92712214  

Get Outlook for iOS 

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, January 5, 2021 5:07:26 PM 

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Subject: SLH9072Z & GX1637Y Doa 3/1/21  

  

Dear Sir / Mdm , 

  

Enclosed is our client GiA report. 

Please let us have your 10 name list of surveyor to survey our client vehicle. Thanks  

  

Best Regards  

Chris Chan  

Green Forest Automobile Pte Ltd  

Hp:92712214  

  

Get Outlook for iOS 

EMAIL DISCLAIMER 

The information contained in this email communication is confidential. You should only read, disclose, re-transmit, 

copy, distribute, act in reliance on or commercialize the information if you are authorized to do so. If you are not the 

intended recipient of this email communication, please notify the sender by replying to the email and destroy any 

electronic or paper copy of this message. 

Any views expressed in this email communication are those of the individual sender. ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. does 

not represent, warrant or guarantee that the integrity of this communication has been maintained or that the 

communication is free of errors, virus or interference. 

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. asserts copyright in respect to this email including any attachment. No part may be 

reproduced by any process or for any purpose without prior written permission. 
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