
1

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 27 September 2021 11:17 AM

To: Boo seng yak; Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR; Carrine Leong; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; 

Chang Chee Sing

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SMN9189C - OD AIG - SURVEYED 7 JAN 21

Dear Mr Boo, 
 
 
Confirm repair cost of $12,024.32 @ 4 days. 
 
Kindly forward invoice and discharge voucher for us to close file.  
 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

From: Boo seng yak [mailto:boojohnny@gmail.com]  

Sent: Friday, 24 September 2021 6:07 PM 

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; SUR 

<sur@lkkauto.com>; Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang 

Chee Sing <claims@premiumauto.com.sg> 

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SMN9189C - OD AIG - SURVEYED 7 JAN 21 

 
Hi Taufikh and all, 
 
Revised estimate, re-survey docs and photographs is attached. 
 
Please confirm repair cost of $12,024.32 @ 4 days. 
 
Your early closure is well appreciated. 
 
 
Best regards - Johnny Boo 


