Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your email.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Monday, 22 March 2021 9:26 AM

MG Solution

CS A Team; Admin A

RE: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SML490B & GX8128D on
24/12/2020

DV_SML490B.pdf

We confirm settlement at $17,406.45(all-in).

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return together with your repair tax invoice to us (LKK) for our necessary

action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 18 March 2021 9:53 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SML490B & GX8128D on 24/12/2020

Your Ref: CC6/11121000083/Apa3 (GX8128D)

Our Ref: SML490B

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We refer to your email, we would like to counter propose as per below:
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Repair cost $16,799.00 (Inclusive of GST) - Agreed

LOU S 600.00 (6 days x $100) - Request: including of 1 Public Holiday: 01/01/2021
LTA Search S 7.45 (Inclusive of GST) - Agreed
Total $17,406.45

Best Regards,

Ms Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD

No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre

#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Thu, Mar 18, 2021 at 9:05 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $17,300.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 17 March 2021 11:47 AM

To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle SML490B & GX8128D on 24/12/2020

Your Ref: CC6/11121000083/Apa3 (GX8128D)

Our Ref: SML490B

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please refer to the below mentioned email, as we have sent out our LOD previously to your side on
08/02/2021.

We have not received any offer from your side.

Resend LOD for your reference and hope to receive an offer from your side soon.

Best Regards,

Ms Wong
MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

AAS Kaki Bukit Centre



#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Mon, Feb 8, 2021 at 2:30 PM MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com> wrote:

Your Ref: CC6/11121000083/Apa3 (GX8128D)

Our Ref: SML490B

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please find attached our LOD for your onward action.
Please feel free to contact the under mentioned should you require any further information.
Your prompt action will be greatly appreciated.

Best Regards,

Ms Wong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD
No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre
#02-03B Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376

On Mon, Jan 25, 2021 at 4:16 PM Sharon <mg3solution@gmail.com> wrote:
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Our Ref: SML490B

LKK Ref: CC6/11121000083/Apa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We refer to below, please find attached video for your reference.
Your client was going straight instead of turning on a ‘ right turn “ only lane.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Sharon Chia

MG Solution Pte Ltd

Phone: 6243-1373 | fax: 6243 1376

23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 | S(415933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 25 January, 2021 3:58 PM

To: 'mg3solution@gmail.com' <mg3solution@gmail.com>

Subject: [Request for Evidence] - Your Ref: SML490B// LKK Ref: CC6/11121000083/Apa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING GX
8128D(II1) AND SML 490B ON 24/12/2020]

Your Ref: SML490B Without Prejudice

LKK Ref: CC6/11121000083/Apa3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GX 8128D(IIl) AND SML 490B ON 24/12/2020
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We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear. Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy
reference.

As per Il instruction, we would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our
necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)



