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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 24 June 2021 12:10 PM
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: FW: SLC4177P & SMP9223A DOA 17.12.20 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG21000080/Aba3  
Attachments: INVOICE.pdf; lta fee.pdf; SLC4177P_17122020.pdf; LOA.png

 

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 10 March, 2021 5:53 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SLC4177P & SMP9223A DOA 17.12.20  
 
Dear Sir / Mdm ,  
 
Enclosed is our client's GIA , LOA & INVOICE  
As request  
 
1) RC    $963  ( $900 + 7% GST )  
2 ) LOU$120  ( $60 X 2 DAYS )  
3 ) LTA $7.45 
 
@ 100% ( DIRECT FROM BEHIND )  
 
TOTAL      $1090.45 
 
Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks  
 
Regards,  
Chris Chan Pick Yuen 
NEW ZEN WERKZ PTE LTD  
HP: 92712214 



28/12/2020



06 08 21





Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 23 Dec 2020 / 12:27:25

Receipt Date/Time : 23 Dec 2020 / 12:27:25

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-201223-001969

Previous Receipt No. : 

S/N Item Description/

Business Transaction Reference 

No.

Amount 

Before 

GST (S$)

GST 

Amount 

(S$)

Amount 

After GST 

(S$)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SMP9223B

As at 17 Dec 2020/17:15:00

Insurance Co: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD. 
1 Insurance Enquiry - SMP9223B

Enquiry Fee   

20201223122620393040 

7.00 0.49 7.49

Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49

Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49

Rounding Difference 0.04

Total Amount Payable 7.45

Paid By

20201223122641299 
Direct Debit: eNETS Debit 

(Internet Banking)
7.45

Total 7.45

Cash Change 0.00

Tendered Amount 7.45

Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service 

provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee 

may apply. 

> Back to OneMotoring

Page 1 of 1Feedback

23/12/2020https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/completePayment?FUNCTION_ID=F1301001TT
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 24 June 2021 12:43 PM
To: SAINGHUAT@YAHOO.COM.SG; NELLE_WEN81@HOTMAIL.COM
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMP 9223B AND SLC 4177P ON 17/12/2020

Our Ref: CC6/AIG21000080/Aea3 
                
 
24 JUNE 2021 
                                       
NG SAING HUAT / CHEW XIANG WEN 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMP 9223B AND SLC 4177P ON 17/12/2020 
 
We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the 
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 
 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to 
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please 
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for 
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD 
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.  
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
Yours faithfully, 
 
Asher 
Case Handler 
DID: 6841 6051 
FAX: 6741 4108 
Email: Ashersng@lkkauto.com 
 
c.c.      AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd    
             (Motor Claims Dept) 
 



8/3/2021 Merimen e-Claims

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=86652508&CFTOKEN=70fc78a049457a9b-6E… 1/1

Print Received Message



This mail is associated with :



*SLC4177P (6059617335SG)

[SMP9223B]
TP

WONG FU HONG @ WONG FU HON
Dec 17 2020 5:00PM
[NG SAING HUAT]

New Zen Werkz Pte Ltd





From   AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 03/08/2021 17:25 PM.
To   LKK_HQ
Subject   Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$1090.45) - SLC4177P - Claim Handler: Goh, Jeremy-CX


Approved:1090.45:mandate approved. subject to documents in order.




