Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 February 2021 10:34 AM

To: ‘Keith Leo Chi Yung'

Cc: '‘Bernard Wan Chong Huat'; 'Teng Wai Khan'; 'Mohamad Bin Mohd Sanif'; ‘Wendy Loh
Shu Wuen'; 'Toh Jing Xuan'; Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINAL REPORT / SME2541L / DS CLAIM / YOUR REF NO.:
SNM21D200016/c02/GBD8646P/Chngpw

Attachments: SME2541 marking.pdf; final.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Hi Keith,

COR $10,550.19, 6 days.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Keith Leo Chi Yung [mailto:keith.leo.chiyung@simedarby.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 2 February 2021 7:52 PM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Cc: Bernard Wan Chong Huat; Teng Wai Khan; Mohamad Bin Mohd Sanif; Wendy Loh Shu Wuen; Toh Jing Xuan; 'Denise
Tay (LKKAuto)'

Subject: RE: FINAL REPORT / SME2541L / DS CLAIM / YOUR REF NO.: SNM21D200016/c02/GBD8646P/Chngpw

Dear Taufikh

The COR should be $10550.19 as below:

Total Labour : 6,682.00
Total Parts : 3,868.19
Total Labour & Paris 10,550.19

We need to re- finalise. Apologise for the inconvenice caused. There are some errors resulting in missing parts not in
the file



DESCRIPTION LNIT PRICE QY DS, % METT

& PREMILIM REAR WANDSCREEMN 25234 1.00 25234

REAR BUMPER PANEL PRIMED (MPDC) 1.191.80 1.00 119160

LETTERIMNG X1 B4.75 1.00 84,75

BLMFP STOF 320 10.00 3200

REAR WINDOW (ESG) B51.00 1.00 851.00

= RH PANMEL TAIL LID (SCHWARZT) 31.85 .00 31.65

r EXPANDING RWET BLACK 1.40 10000 14,00

= REAR REFLECTOR REAR RH 39.05 1.00 F305

REAR RH LIGHT N TRUMNK LID 2390 1.00 279.90

REAR RH LIGHT IN THE SIDE PANEL IS99.05 1.00 35585

(DG) CLEAMER R (100ML) 26.15 1.00 26.15

(DGSLY WISCREEN SEALANT (COLD 1 HOUR) 12155 200 26310

g (DGSLWDHESIVE PRIMER VP 206 (30ML 27.85 1.00 27.85
- SUPPLEMENTARY ITEMS

Total Labour ; 6,5652.00

Totad Parts : 347324

Totad Labour & Parts 10,155.24

Deaduction for Excess 2 .00

Total Repar Costs less P 10,155.24

GST &7 F 1087

Grand Totsl 105511

Warm Regards

Keith Leo
Workshop Manager
Bodyshop

BMW
Performance Motors Limited

TEL: +65 1800 2255 269

DDI: +65 6319 0172

FAX: +65 6479 4601

Address : 303 Alexandra Road, Singapore 159941
EMail: keith.leo.chiyung@simedarby.com.sg

www.bmw.com.sg

Sime Darby Motors
A member of the Sime Darby Group

&) DRIVE HOME A WINNER.

Ninning maodels.

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the named
addressee ("the Recipient") and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the
Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the
intended Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message.
Please notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime
Darby disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being infected by computer



virus or other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message are solely those of the
author's and do not necessarily represent those of Sime Darby's.”

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 2 February 2021 1:03 pm

To: Keith Leo Chi Yung <keith.leo.chiyung@simedarby.com.sg>

Cc: Bernard Wan Chong Huat <bernard.wan@simedarby.com.sg>; Teng Wai Khan <teng.wai.khan@simedarby.com.sg>;
Mohamad Bin Mohd Sanif <mohd.sanif@simedarby.com.sg>; Wendy Loh Shu Wuen
<wendy.loh.shuwuen@simedarby.com.sg>; Toh Jing Xuan <toh.jing.xuan@simedarby.com.sg>; 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)'
<denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINAL REPORT / SME2541L / DS CLAIM / YOUR REF NO.: SNM21D200016/c02/GBD8646P/Chngpw

[External Mail] This email originated from outside of the organisation; be careful with requests, attachments and links.

Hi Keith,
COR $10,155.24, 6 days.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Keith Leo Chi Yung [mailto:keith.leo.chiyung@simedarby.com.sq]

Sent: Monday, 25 January 2021 6:29 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Bernard Wan Chong Huat; Teng Wai Khan; Mohamad Bin Mohd Sanif; Wendy Loh Shu Wuen; Toh Jing Xuan; Shiau
Chan (LKKAuto); EIiE ©

Subject: RE: FINAL REPORT / SME2541L / DS CLAIM / YOUR REF NO.: SNM21D200016/c02/GBD8646P/Chngpw

Dear Taufikh

We refer to above matter and attachment Final Report.
Kindly confirm quantum for COR:

Total Labour : 6,682.00

Total Parts : 3,473.24

Total Labour & Parts : 10,155.24
Repair work days : 6 days.

Warm Regards

Keith Leo
Workshop Manager
Bodyshop

BMW
Performance Motors Limited

TEL: +65 1800 2255 269

DDI: +65 6319 0172

FAX: +65 6479 4601

Address : 303 Alexandra Road, Singapore 159941



EMail: keith.leo.chiyung@simedarby.com.sg

www.bmw.com.sg

Sime Darby Motors
A member of the Sime Darby Group

(@) DRIVE HOME AWINNER,

WEF OUF & O At |II } MG dels.

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the named
addressee ("the Recipient") and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the
Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the
intended Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message.
Please notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime
Darby disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being infected by computer
virus or other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message are solely those of the
author's and do not necessarily represent those of Sime Darby's.”

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWWw.avg.com




