Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Peggy <nphauto@pacific.net.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 February 2021 1:09 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SLT 8222B (OUR REF: CC6/AIG21000018/T1ga3) *** ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SLZ 9512B & SLT 8222B ON 19/12/2020 ***

Attachments: SKMBT_C224e21022413060.pdf

Dear Cecilia

We refer to the above matter and claiming against you as follows:

Cost of repair $1,926.00
Loss of use 2 days @$150 per day 300.00
LTA fee 7.45
Total $2,233.45

Attach documents and please let us have your reply soon.

REGARDS

PEGGY FOO

NPH AUTO SERVICE

TEL: 67840663

EMAIL: peggy@nphauto.com

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 19 January 2021 4:09 PM

To: NPHAUTO@PACIFIC.NET.SG

Subject: YOUR REF: SLT 8222B (OUR REF: CC6/AIG21000018/T1ga3) *** ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ 9512B & SLT
8222B ON 19/12/2020 ***

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear roy,
We refer to the above matter.

Below is a copy of OI report for your easy reference.
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RELEASE VOUCHER

(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, NPH_AUTO SERVICE (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an
agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for $$963.00
(Repair Cost), $$80.00 (Loss of Use/Rental), $87.45 (Disbursement) for vehicle no. SLT 8222B that
was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 19/12/2020 (date) along KALLANG
LEISURE PARK TWDS NATIONAL STADIUM (location) involving vehicle no/s SLZ 9512B.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 23/12/2020 (date) at “the workshop”.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner CHUAN MENG ELECTRICAL
CONTRACTOR (“the third party claimant”) of vehicle no. SLT 8222B make the claim as set out
in the above paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner
that we/l deem fit. We/I enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant”
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to SLT
82228 (vehicle no.) as a resuit of the accident.

We/I confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this _ 06 (day) of _APRIL (month) 20_21 (year)

()

Signed by appointed surveyor




(MY ) NPH AUTO SERVICE

Block 9005 Tampines Street 93 #01-246,/254 Sin
GST Reg No: MX-0869103

E-mail; nphauto@pacific.net.sg

i
gapore 528839 Tel: 67840663 (8 Lines) Fax: 67840692 ‘
-NO . Business Reg No: 394773/00D ]

Registration No : QMK - 8G

Our Ref

:TP0051/12/20

CHUAN MENG ELECTRICAL CONTRACTOR

TAX INVOICE NO.

Date of
Accident Date

Policy Number

:19/12/2020
:MAQ10371

9003 Tampines Street 93
#02-182 Singapore 528837

Model ¢BMW 730LI

Veh Reg No : SLT8222B

Date :24/02/2021

LABOUR CHARGES

DEAR SIR

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT WE HEREBY AGREED TO
REPAIR THE ABOVE VEHICLE AT:

LUM SUM $1,800.00

$1,80C.00
$126.00
$1,926.00

Nett Total Before GST
Add GST @ 7%

Nett Total After GST

{One Thousand and Nine Huandred Twenty Six Only Fifty Cents)

NPH AUTO SERVICE
(MANAGER)



> Back to OneMotoring

Land Transport Authority

Land Transport Autherity

10 Sin Ming Drive

Eingapnore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-000652¢.2

Print Date/Time :

22 Dec 2020/ 10:31:28

Receipt Date/Time : 22 Dec 2020/ 10:31:28

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-201222-00108%
Previcus Receipt No. :
S/N item Description/

Business Transaction Reference
No.
Result of insurance Enquiry - SLZ85128
As at 18 Dec 2020/19:30:00
Insurance Co: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
1 Insurance Enquiry - SLZ8512B
Enquiry Fee
20201222102944286300
Sub-Tota!

Total Before Rounding
Rounding Difference
Total Amount Payable

Paid By
540188XXXXXX4231

Total

Cash Change

Tendered Amount

Excess Refundable Amount

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Amount GST
Before Amount
GST (s$) (S$)
7.00 .49
7.00 0.49
7.00 049

eNETS Credit Card

Amount
After GST
(S$)

7.49

7.49
7.49
0.04
7.45

745
745
0.00
745
0.00

Please ensure that all payments to the A(Jghority are good and promptly settled by the payment service

provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt

may apply.

is considered void and late fee



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire Vehicle's Insurance Particulars

Thank You!

The insurance details of the vehicle you enquired can be found below. If you have entered
avalid email address, a copy would have been sent to you.

Vehicle No. incident Date/Time Insurance Company Name
SLZ9512B 19 Dec 2020/ 19:30:00 AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE.LTD.
Save as PDF OK >

Print



Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 January 2021 3:01 PM

To: SUJAYSK@HOTMAIL.COM

Subject: <STANDARD LETTER> OUR REF CC6/AIG21000018/T1ga3 *** ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SLZ 9512B & SLT 8222B ON 19/12/2020 ***

Our Ref: CC6/A1G21000018/T1ga3

19 JANUARY 2021

SUBRAMANIAM KRISHNASWAMY SUJAY

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ 9512B & SLT 8222B ON 19/12/2020

We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster Company by your Motor Insurer
(AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd) to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from SLT 8222B.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario and pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or
your authorized driver had amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred,
we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party
claimant. Unless proven otherwise.

If you have evidence/information(VIDEO FOOTAGE) to proof that we should not settle the third party claim,
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 29/01/2021, after we shall proceed with

negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any
claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it
will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

c.C. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,



Cecilia Chony | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ld

Phone: 67494274 | email: CeciliaChong@(KkKauto.com | fax; 67414108
BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

¥ EZRS o,
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4/5/2021 Merimen e-Claims
Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SLT8222B (3987416679SG)
[SLZ9512B]
TP
CHUAN MENG ELECTRICAL CONTRACTOR
Dec 19 2020 7:00PM
[SUBRAMANIAM KRISHNASWAMY SUJAY]
NPH Auto Service

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 24/03/2021 10:03 AM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$1070.45) - SLT8222B - Claim Handler: Loh, Chee-Heng

Approved:1070.45.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=83356916&CFTOKEN=b1943c99190e47c2-3F14B988-EO0CD-9D2C-5738B815011F994A&USID=9765&RID=853683... 1/1



