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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Erofia Motor - LeeLee Tan <erofia@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 8 January 2021 12:08 PM

To: 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)'

Subject: FW: Request pre-repair inspection for accident involving SCF93P and JRJ5716 on 26 

December 2020 || C10008538 

 

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: Erofia Motor - LeeLee Tan [mailto:erofia@singnet.com.sg] 

Sent: 30 December, 2020 2:33 PM 

To: 'Ivy Ratilla' <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: Request pre-repair inspection for accident involving SCF93P and 

JRJ5716 on 26 December 2020 || C10008538  

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sir 

 

Kindly arrange Marcus Chua of LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

 

Thank you 

 

Regards 

LeeLee Tan 

Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd 

Tel: 67527740 

Fax: 67528669 

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: Ivy Ratilla [mailto:ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg] 

Sent: 30 December, 2020 2:29 PM 

To: erofia@singnet.com.sg; Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Cc: Stanley Lai <stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: Request pre-repair inspection for accident involving SCF93P and 

JRJ5716 on 26 December 2020 || C10008538  

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sirs, 

 

Please find the list of our proposed surveyors. 

 

Mr. William Ng   (A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Xing Guo Qiang   (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Mohammed Rasul   (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Mohamad Taufihk   (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Adrian Ling   (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Marcus Chua   (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Kenneth Kong   (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Pang Kiah Keen (Frankie)   (FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Chua Soo Teck (Benjamin)   (FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd) 
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Mr. Ng You Han   (FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Soon HanXin (Gary)   (FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Chow Bo Xiong   (FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd) 

Mr. Derrick Quok - our in house surveyor Mr. Kenneth Lim - our in house surveyor 

 

Kindly let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor 

surveyors. 

 

Regards, 

 

 

Ivy Ratilla 

Executive, Claims Admin 

 

T +65 6540 2185 

F +65 6725 0853 

E ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg 

 

 

 

Customer Care +65 6221 2111 

Claims +65 6221 2199 

Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 

 

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 

Singapore Shopping Centre 

Singapore 239924 

budgetdirect.com.sg 

 

 

 

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct Insurance. 

 

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is 

for the intended addressee. 

The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect 

views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the 

intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure 

of this email is unauthorised. 

 

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is 

for the intended addressee. 

The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect 

views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the 

intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure 

of this email is unauthorised. 

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: Erofia Motor - LeeLee Tan <erofia@singnet.com.sg> 

Sent: Wednesday, 30 December 2020 1:22 PM 

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 

Subject: Request pre-repair inspection for accident involving SCF93P and 

JRJ5716 on 26 December 2020 

 

Dear Sir/Mdm 
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With reference to the above mentioned, attached necessary documents for your arrangement of pre-repair 

inspection for our client's 

 

Motorcycle No: JRJ5716 

 

Workshop: 

 

Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd 

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #02-62 

AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit 

Singapore 417883 

 

Tel: 67527740 

 

Thank you 

 

Regards 

LeeLee Tan 

Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd 

Tel: 67527740 

Fax: 67528669 

 

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited, 

Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee. 

The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect 

views of Auto & General. 

This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. 

If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference 

with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify 

the sender and then delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free. 


