Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Dear Irene,
Attached payment slip FYI.
Thanks.

Damian

Rico 60 <enquiry@rico60.com>

Monday, 23 May 2022 3:17 PM

Irene Tay; Rico 60 Claims; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Re: PURCHASE OF SURVEY REPORT FOR SDA 1288 C; DOA : 25/12/2020
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On Mon, 23 May 2022 at 15:10, Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com> wrote:

$235.40

From: Rico 60 <enquiry@rico60.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 May 2022 3:07 PM

To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: Re: PURCHASE OF SURVEY REPORT FOR SDA 1288 C; DOA : 25/12/2020

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Irene,
Kindly advise amount . Will do the payment today .

Damian

On Mon, 23 May 2022 at 3:02 PM, Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Please remit the payment into our current account as belows:

Bank: OCBC Bank

Address: 65 Chulia Street, OCBC Centre, Singapore 049513

A/c Name: China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
A/c No: 501-739486-001 (SS)

Swift Code: OCBCSGSG

Bank code: 7339

Branch code: 501

Please inform us immediately upon successfully transferring of money into our bank account.



Thank you.

Irene Tay

From: claims@rico60.com <claims@rico60.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 May 2022 2:48 PM

To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; veronchen@Ikkauto.com; 'Claims' <claims@rico60.com>
Cc: 'Settlement' <settlement.rico60@gmail.com>; enquiry@rico60.com

Subject: RE: PURCHASE OF SURVEY REPORT FOR SDA 1288 C; DOA : 25/12/2020

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Irene,
As spoken, we are writing for your consent that we will purchase directly for the 3P Surveyor report for the above
case. Which LKK shall not bill CT for this report.

Dear Veron,
As spoken, please prepare report and invoice for this report.

RICO will bear this payment. Do let me know when its ready to collect.
Thanks.

RICO Damian

From: RICO CLAIMS <claims@rico60.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 10, 2022 1:16 PM

To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Settlement <settlement.rico60@gmail.com>; enquiry@rico60.com

Subject: RE: PURCHASE OF SURVEY REPORT FOR SDA 1288 C; DOA : 25/12/2020

Any updates?

Best Regards,

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

From: claims@rico60.com

Sent: Thursday, 5 May 2022 1:14 PM

To: Irene Tay; Claims

Cc: Settlement; enquiry@rico60.com

Subject: RE: PURCHASE OF SURVEY REPORT FOR SDA 1288 C; DOA : 25/12/2020
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Dear Irene,
Please advise if we are able to purchase survey report??

Thanks.

RICO Damian

From: claims@rico60.com <claims@rico60.com>

Sent: Monday, April 25,2022 7:05 PM

To: 'lrene Tay' <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; 'Claims' <claims@rico60.com>
Cc: 'Settlement' <settlement.rico60@gmail.com>; enquiry@rico60.com

Subject: RE: PURCHASE OF SURVEY REPORT FOR SDA 1288 C; DOA : 25/12/2020

Dear Irene,
Please advise if we are able to purchase for your surveyor report for the wrongly surveyed case?

We need to forward it to Tokio Marine for our claim to be process.
Please assist.
Thanks.

RICO

From: Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 13, 2022 12:37 AM

To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Settlement <settlement.rico60@gmail.com>; Yee Pei Li <YeePeiLi@tokiomarine.com.sg>; enquiry@rico60.com
Subject: Re: PURCHASE OF SURVEY REPORT FOR SDA 1288 C; DOA : 25/12/2020

Dear irene,
Kindly advise on how payment should be made.
Thanks.

On Wed, 13 Apr 2022 at 12:35 AM, Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com> wrote:

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Kindly let have your payment before we release the survey report.

Regards,

Irene Tay

Claims Department (Motor Division)



China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: (65) 63896192 | F:(65) 62247478/62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: X3l Taiping
SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and
may contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this
message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the
sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

Irene Tay

Claims Department (Motor Division)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: (65) 63896192 | F:(65) 62247478/62247175

W: www.sg.cnfaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: K3t Taiping
SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files fransmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and
may contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this
message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the
sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Accounts <claims@rico60.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 12 April 2022 1:56 PM
To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>




Cc: Yee Pei Li <YeePeiLi@tokiomarine.com.sg>; enquiry@rico60.com; Settlement
<settlement.rico60@gmail.com>
Subject: FW: PURCHASE OF SURVEY REPORT FOR SDA 1288 C ; DOA : 25/12/2020

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Best Regards,

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

From: Accounts

Sent: Tuesday, 12 April 2022 1:50 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Yee Pei Li; enquiry@rico60.com; Settlement

Subject: PURCHASE OF SURVEY REPORT FOR SDA 1288 C; DOA : 25/12/2020

Dear China Taiping,

We would like to purchase your survey report for vehicle SDA 1288 C as we arranged PRI of the wrong insurance .
Kindly advise on payment .

Best Regards,

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Regards,

Jesski Low

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.



Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M
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#02-24, Singapore 415875
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Email: claims@rico60.com




