Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 6 May 2021 6:28 PM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: GBK2981Z TOYOTA HIACE

From: Darren <claims@teamworkgarage.com>

Sent: Thursday, 6 May 2021 6:27:45 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GBK2981Z TOYOTA HIACE

Hi Taufikh,
We confirmed amount.

Darren

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

53 Ubi Avenue 1

#01-24/#01-34 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408934

Tel: 68442475

Fax: 68442474

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 April 2021 1:07 PM
To: 'Darren’

Cc: 'Veron Chen (LKKAuto)'

Subject: RE: GBK2981Z TOYOTA HIACE

Hi Darren,
COR I/s $1450, 3 days.
Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Darren [mailto:claims@teamworkgarage.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 17 March 2021 4:42 PM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: GBK2981Z TOYOTA HIACE

Dear Taufikh,
REMINDER
Please let us have the finalize amount soonest.

Darren



Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

53 Ubi Avenue 1

#01-24/#01-34 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408934

Tel: 68442475

Fax: 68442474

From: Darren

Sent: Tuesday, 26 January 2021 2:52 PM
To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Subject: GBK2981Z TOYOTA HIACE

Hi Taufikh,
FYNA
Based on estimate calculation:

COR @ $1550
DOR @ 4 Days

Kindly revise and get back to us on the finalize amount.

Darren

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

53 Ubi Avenue 1

#01-24/#01-34 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408934

Tel: 68442475

Fax: 68442474



