Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 29 April 2021 11:51 AM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: OD SKX5287A

Attachments: SKX5287A final2_210429_114654.pdf
Hi Shiau Chan,

Finalize amount $3,396.31. Repair day 5 days. (P/P, before gst).
Please refer attachment.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 April, 2021 1:39 PM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: OD SKX5287A

Hi Shiau Chan,

Already confirm with workshop.

Finalize amount $3,456.08. Repair day 5 days. (P/P, before gst).
Please refer attachment.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Oi Sun Pinl Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




