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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 5 March 2021 12:41 PM

To: 'Boo seng yak'; SUR

Cc: 'Carrine Leong'; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Premiumauto Claims

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SMW3596C - TP CHINA - SURVEYED 9 JAN 21

Dear Mr Boo, 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Confirm final fig $2,802.00 before GST and  3 repair days. 

 

Kindly send the relevant documents to China Taiping Insurance company. 

 
Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 3 March, 2021 4:57 PM 

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>; Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang 

Chee Sing <claims@premiumauto.com.sg> 

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SMW3596C - TP CHINA - SURVEYED 9 JAN 21 

 

hi Adrian and all, 

 

Revised etimate and photographs is attached. 

 

Please confirm repair cost of $2802.00 @ 3 days. 

 

Your early closure is well appreciated. 

 

 

Best regards - jb 


