Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: February 9, 2021 5:14 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Cc: Jojo Cheng; Lauro Araos Songcuan JR; Andre Chow En De; SUR; Admin A
Subject: SLZ1928M, claim TP AIG SKX497T, DOA: 28.12.2020

Attachments: [Untitled].pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Our customer, SLZ1928M holds your insured driver, SKX497T, liable for the accident dated
28/12/2020, and would like to claim against your insured driver.

Our customer's claim is for :

Excess : $ 5,014.61
Loss Of Use : $ 749.00 ($107 per day for 7 days)
Total Claim $ 5,763.61

If you minded to reach an amicable settlement with our customer, please let us have your
substantive reply by 23/03/2021. Otherwise our customer will proceed in a manner that he
deems fit.

Best Regards,

Loi Ai Ting

@@ Exceptional Journeys

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Cycle & Carriage Singapore « 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
T: +65 6568 4556 « F: +65 6565 1240 < www.cyclecarriage.com.sg

I N
&? A member of the Jardine Cycle & Carriage Group

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the
views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.



€e

CYCLE & CARRIAGE

Exceptional lourneys

To:

Cycle & Carriage Automotive Pte Limited /
209 Pandan Gardens,

Singapore 609339

Attention: [Motor Claims Depariment]
Date: [29.12.2020]

LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

Dear Sirs,

1. I/\We, the undersigned, am the registered owner of vehicle no. SLZ1928M (vehicle no.) {the
“Vehicle").

2 As a result of a motor incident occurring on 28.12.2020(date and time of accident) onfalong BUKIT

TIMAH ROAD TOWARDS CAVENAGH ROAD (location) between the Vehicle and SKX497T(3%
party vehicle(s) number, if any) (the "Accident”), the Vehicle was damaged and has been sent in
for repairs to be conducted at Cycle & Carriage’s workshop.

3. I/We hereby authorize Cycle & Carriage to act for and on my/our behaif in respect of the following:

(a) to submit, make, settle and/or resolve any claims {the “Claims”) which l/iwe may have
against third party insurers andfor any other parties (“Third Parties”) arising out of the
Accident, in any manner as it deems fit;

(b) to receive payment from any Third Parties as settlement for the Claims (including accepting
cheques made out in favour of Cycle & Carriage); and

(c) to generally do or cause to be done all acts or things (including signing any forms or
documents or giving instructions to any Third Parties) which it deems necessary or
expedient for the foregoing purposes.

4, In addition to the above, I/We hereby further authorize Cycle & Carriage, for and on our behalf, to

execute and sian any discharqe vouchers, indemnity forms and/or any other forms or
documents in relation to or arising from the Claims.

For the avoidance of doubt, all payments towards settlement of the Claims should be made in
favour of Cycle & Carriage.
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I'We further acknowledge and recognize that any settlement which Cycle & Carriage may make for
and on my/our behalf in respect of any Claims may be on a without prejudice basis and without any
admission of liability in so far as any other Third Parties are concerned.

Thank you.

Yours faithfully,

Name: Lee Heok Yong
NRIC / Passport No. / Company Registration No.: 7561



RELEASE VOUCHER
{AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l,_ Cycle & Carriage Automotive Pte Ltd (“the workshop”) hereby confirm that we/l have
reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for 8§
5,014.61(Repair Cost), $$749.00 (Loss of Rental), $8- (Disbursement) for vehicle no. SLZ 1928M
that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 28/12/2020 (date) along Bukit Timah
Reoad (location) involving vehicle no/s SKX 497T. This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on
29/12/2028 (date) at “the workshop”.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner LEE HEQK YONG (the third party
claimant”) of vehicle no, SLZ 1928M make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/lI will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant”
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to
SL.Z 1928M (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

th .
Dated this 28 (day) of :['“ ot {month) 2021 (year)

~
()
—/ @

Signed by appointed surveyor Slgnéd‘ﬁy “the workshop” (with cho

SIGNED WITHOUT PREJUDICE FOR
ANY PERSONAL INJURY CLAIM



% @ CYCLE & CARRIAGE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LIMITED !
PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE MITSUBISHI
CYCLE & CARRIAGE 209 Pandan Gardens Singapore 609339 Tel: 65684555 Fax: 65691056 MOTORS
TAX INVOICE
Co Reg No : 197701469G GST Reg No : MR-8500111-X
Invoice Name & Address Owner Name & Vehicle Info
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Cust No/Name /Lee Heok Yong
Ltd. Reg No/Reg Date SLZ1928M / 26/04/2018
MOTOR CLAIM DEPT Date In/Mileage 13/01/2021/ 44313
;?GSSE¥ES¥N2AY #09=18 Chassis/Package MMBSTA13AJHO01855
SINGAPORE 079120 Engine No 3A92UGS5536
Contact No 6419 18592 Make/Model MIT/18MY ATTRAGE 1.2 CVT
13/01/2021 Colour/Trim W05 WHITE PEARL / BK BLACK
Account No Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator WIP No Invoice/Credit Note No
KAX0Q0008 Credit 09/02/2021/ 16:57 TLD 260 / AiTing 61278 41469544
Description of Goods / Services Qty Unit Price Disc% Amount
E PNT88000 900.00
REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS, REPLACE RH REAR DOOR, REPAIR REAR BUMPER,
REAR BODY KITS, RH REAR FENDER, RH SIDE SKIRTING, RH FRONT DOOR, AND
ALL OTHER AFFECTED AREAS, ADJUST AND ALIGN BODY GAPS ALIGNMENT TO THE
SAME
E PNT88000 120.00
TRANSFER RH REAR DOOR TRIM, DOOR GLASS, MECHANISMS, AND ALL OTHER
ATTACHMENTS TO NEW DOOR PANEL
E PNT98000 2100.00
RESPRAY ON RH REAR DOOR, REAR BUMPER, REAR BODY KITS, RH REAR FENDER,
RH SIDE SKIRTING, RH FRONT DOOR, AND ALL OTHER AFFECTED AREAS TC THE
SAME
M SUNDRY 490,00
APPLY BODY SEALANT ON AFFECTED
A 54900099 30.00
CHECK WIRING AND CHASSIS ELECTRICAL SYSTEM
M SUNDRY 40.00
PERFORM RUST PREVENTION ON AFFECTED AREAS
A 100283801 120.00
CONDUCT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK USING MUT TESTER AND CLEAR TROUBLE CODE
A WHEELALIGNMENTBP 120.00
CONDUCT COMPUTERIZE FULL WHEEL ALIGNMENT
M SUNDRY 20.00
SUNDRIES
S SPECIALISTJOB 30.00
TRANSFER RH REAR SPORTS RIM, REPLACE TIRE VALVE, CONDUCT WHEEL
BALANCING
X PANEL ASSY,RR DOOR,RH 1.00 799.00 23.00 615.23
X TAPE,RR DOOR SASH,RH 1.00 29.00 23.00 22.33
X WHEEL,DISC 1.00 687.00 23.00 528.99
Z TEXT
TP CLAIM AIG SKX497T
DOA : 28.12.20

Payment should be made strictly by cash, NETS or credit cards. Thank you.

Any dispute to the invoice must be made within 3 days. This is a computer generatedf document, no signature is required.

Page 1 of 2
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CYCLE & CARRIAGE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LIMITED
PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE

o

MITSUBISHI
CYCLE & CARRIAGE 209 Pandan Gardens Singapore 609339 Tel: 65684555 Fax: 65691056 MOTORS
TAX INVOICE
Co Reg No : 1977014696 GST Reg No : MR-8500111-X
Invoice Name & Address Owner Name & Vehicle Info
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Cust No/Name /Lee Heok Yong
Ltd. Reg No/Reg Date SLZ1928M / 26/04/2018
MOTOR CLAIM DEPT Date In/Mileage 13/01/2021/ 44313
78 SHENTON WAY #09-16 .
AIG BUILDING Chas:.s1s/Packa_qe MMBSTA13AJHO01855
Contact No 6419 1892 Make/Model MIT/18MY ATTRAGE 1.2 CVT
13/01/2021 Colour/Trim W05 WHITE PEARL / BK BLACK
Account No Terms Date/Time Printed CSE Operator WIP No  Invoice/Credit Note No
KAX00008 Credit 09/02/2021/ 16:57 TLD 260 / AiTing 61278 41469544
Description of Goods / Services Qty  Unit Price Disc% Amount
SURVEYOR  STEVE (LKK) 29.12.20
REPAIR 05 DAYS
Guarantee Your Warranty, Maintain with Cycle & Carriage!
Parts 1,166.55 Nett 4,686.55
Labour 3,390.00 7% GST on 4686.55 328.06
Standard Menu 0.00
Specialist Job 30.00 Total Payable 5,014.61
Diagnostics Job 0.00 Paid 0.00
Sundry/Others 100.00 Total Due 5,014.61
Total (w/o GST) 4,686.55

Payment should be made strictly by cash, NETS or credit cards. Thank you. ) . .
Any dispute to the invoice must be made within 3 days. This is a computer generated document, no signature is required.

Page 2 of 2



CYCLE & CARRIAGE LEASING PTE. LTD.

l 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 602339

@ @ ‘ LEASIN G Tel +65 6254 8880 - Fax +65 6251 8908
www.cyclecarriage.com/sglleasing

CYCLE & CARRIAGE Incorporated in Singapore

Company Reg No. 201800307R

GST Reg No. MR8500111X

Tax Invoice

Lee Heok Yong C/O Cycle & Carriage Automotive Inv No. : RIN21010080
Pte Ltd Date : 20 Jan 2021
- Ref : SLZ1928M, 7561
Singapore - Curr : SGD
Terms :COD
Agreement Period: 13/01/2021- 19/01/2021 RA No. :RRA21010044
Sales : Wilson Ho
# Description Qty Unit Unit Price Amt
1 Rental {13/01/2021 to 19/01/2021) 7.00 Day 100.00 700.00

Vehicle Registration No. : SMQ7079)
Vehicle Model : ATTRAGE 1.2 CVT
Reference No: SI.Z1928M

This is a computer generated document. Subtotal Before GST : S$ 700.00
No signature is required. 7 % GST on §% 700.00: S% 49.00
For Bank Transfer: Total Amt Incl. GST: S$$ 749.00

SCB 01-063-8115-6
DBS 072-009109-4

For PayNow:
PayNow ID (SGD): 201900307RS501
Or scan QR code for payment.

Kindly send payment advice to
cclfinance@cyclecarriage.com.sg

PAGE 1 OF 1



Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 12 March 2021 2:45 PM

To: AVRIL HO

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 497T AND SLZ 1928M ON 28/12/2020

Our Ref: CC4/A1G20014689/Eba3

MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD ( BY EMAIL ONLY )

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 497T AND SLZ 1928M ON 28/12/2020

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



6/30/2021 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SLZ1928M (6631768836SG)
[SKX497T]
TP
LEE HEOK YONG
Dec 28 2020 6:00PM
[MOVA AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD]
Cycle & Carriage Automotive Pte Ltd

| Reply || Reply Al || Mark as Unread || Print Message || Delete Message || Forward |

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 25/06/2021 15:39 PM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$5763.61) - SLZ1928M - Claim Handler: Goh, Jeremy-CX

Approved:5763.61:mandate approved. settle at best. do check to ensure documents are correct and we are not overpaying LOR

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&iinboxid=1864290&iDomainld=11&iObjld=10684...  1/2



https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCobj&fuseaction=dsp_objlink&domainid=1&objid=979270&extid=352388&CFID=85755215&CFTOKEN=b3cfbbf776b8c13d-97212839-F1AC-506B-9972C06AF10D3568&USID=10684&RID=3329216
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=85755215&CFTOKEN=b3cfbbf776b8c13d-97212839-F1AC-506B-9972C06AF10D3568&USID=10684&RID=3329216
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=85755215&CFTOKEN=b3cfbbf776b8c13d-97212839-F1AC-506B-9972C06AF10D3568&USID=10684&RID=3329216
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=85755215&CFTOKEN=b3cfbbf776b8c13d-97212839-F1AC-506B-9972C06AF10D3568&USID=10684&RID=3329216
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=85755215&CFTOKEN=b3cfbbf776b8c13d-97212839-F1AC-506B-9972C06AF10D3568&USID=10684&RID=3329216&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DSVCmail%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_view%26mode%3D1%26iinboxid%3D1864290%26iDomainId%3D11%26iObjId%3D10684%26iRecipientAliasId%3D12%26cur_ialiasid%3D12%26cur_vaalias%3DLKK_HQ%26assocdomain%3D1%26assocobj%3D979270%26assocobj2%3D352388%26urlback%3D%252Fclaims%252Findex%252Ecfm%253Ffusebox%253DMTRadjuster%2526fuseaction%253Ddsp%255Fclmheader%2526caseid%253D979270%2526extid%253D352388%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=85755215&CFTOKEN=b3cfbbf776b8c13d-97212839-F1AC-506B-9972C06AF10D3568&USID=10684&RID=3329216
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