Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: February 2, 2021 12:51 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJC 1198 Y & SJU 8131 Z ON 22 DECEMBER 2020 - CALL FOR
DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Attachments: SJC1198Y_estimate_finalisation.pdf; SJC1198Y_invoice.pdf; SJC1198Y_report.pdf;

SJUB131Z_ins_search.pdf

Your Ref:
Our Ref : SJIC 1198 Y

2 February 2021

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd PROPERTY CLAIM

AIG Building, (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
78 Shenton Way TO: Any Personal Injury
#07-16 Claims)

Singapore 079120

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1,

#02-25

Singapore 408933

Attn: Claims Department
Dear Sir/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJC 1198 Y & SJU 8131 Z ON 22 DECEMBER 2020 - CALL FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Kindly find attached the finalized report for SJIC 1198 Y, as proposed by our Single Joint Expert. We are pleased to inform
that we are agreeable to the amount proposed.

As such, we are writing to your kind office to call for a direct settlement, in relation to the accident involving SJIC 1198 Y
& SJU 8131 Z on 22 December 2020. We will like to know if your company is prepared to settle for the amount as stated
below:

Cost of Repair (amount as proposed by SJE) :$ 6,900.00
Loss of Use (repair days as proposed by SJE) :$ 1,000.00 ($200/day X 5 days)
Loss of Use (for PRI from 24/12/2020 to 29/12/2020) $ 1,000.00 ($200/day X 5 days)
LTA Search :$ 7.45

Total: ! $8,907.45
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We seek your kindest assistance in letting us know whether your kind office is agreeable to the above within the next 7
days and we look forward to you forwarding us the DV (without prejudice to any personal injury claims), if required, so
that we can expedite on its return for an amicable settlement to the matter.

We have also attached a copy of our company’s invoice for SIC 1198 Y, the Singapore Accident Statement of SJC 1198 Y
and LTA search for your easy reference.

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 1% June 2019, we have shifted to and are now operating
from the following address:

37A Everitt Road
Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, December 28, 2020 1:49 PM

To: Teo, Ericweihong <Ericweihong.Teo@aig.com>

Cc: Lim, Kok-Chong <Kok-Chong.Lim@aig.com>; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa <NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>; Hor,
Yinrul <Yinrul.Hor@aig.com>; Subramaniam, Divyashni <Divyashni.Subramaniam@aig.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJC 1198 Y & SJU 8131 Z ON 22 DECEMBER 2020 - APPOINTMENT OF LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (MARCUS CHUA) AS SINGLE JOINT EXPERT

Your Ref:
Our Ref: SIC 1198 Y

28 December 2020

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. PROPERTY CLAIM

AIG Building (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
78 Shenton Way TO: Any Personal Injury
#07-16 Claims)

Singapore 079120

Attn: Claims Department Via Email

Dear Sir/Mdm,



LETTER OF UNDERTAKING & AUTHORISATION

To:  Asia Motorsports Solution Pie Lid WITHOUT PREJUDICE
37A Everntt Road TO: ANY PERSONAL INJURY
Singapore 428586 CLAIMS

In the matter of an accédent involving vehicles SICI1198 Y 3 S Ji Y 8 ’3 }_ Z on
A Decembar 00 |

—

1we GOO HONG TEE the owner of vehicle registration no. ) ‘J—C [ i_ ﬁg_f -

hereby do authorize you to commence repairs to my abovementioned vehicle.

I'We confirm that you are hereby authorized to handle the repairs of my vehicle and/or to
negotiate and settle any claims relating to the above accident which I/'we may have against the
third party/parties or insurers and/or to instruct lawyers on my/our behalf to facilitate the third
party claim for me/us.

You are hereby authorized as my attorney to execute and/or sign any documents/discharge
vouchers/discharge agreement regarding my/our claim for my convenience.

In the event that I'we am/are required fo attend at my/our solicitors” office or to atlend court in
connection with my/our claim, I/we shall render full co-operation.

I confirm that in the event of an unsuccessful claim against the negligent party and/or my own
insurer for the damages caused to my vehicle, I agree to pay all repair cost, survey fee and any
incidental expenses incurred by you or to lodge an own damage claim (only for comprehensive
cover) to cover the expenses incurred.

I undertake not to independently make negotiate or settle any claim in respect of the above
accident without first giving you 7 days notice in writing and upon so doing, I further undertake
to pay to you immediately your administrative charges for work done and time expended in
managing my claim herein. For the purpose of clarification, the aforesaid administrative charges
shall not include any work done or sum expended towards repairs to my said vehicle and in the
event that repair work/s has commenced before the giving of the above notice, I hereby undertake
to pay to you the full sum of the costs of repairs as shall be recommended by a licensed surveyor.

Dated the Jf day of ?ecenber 2020
b

- e (&l

Owner (signature) Witneﬁs (signatiire)
GDO HONG TEE_ LDD CHENG (H HAN
Owner (name) Witness (name)

52129208 51169633C

NRIC No. NRIC No.




RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)
WITHOUT PREJUPICE
To: ANY PERSONAL INJURY (LAIMS
“We/l, ASTA MOTORSPORTS SOLUTION PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that
we/l have reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed
for $7,700.00 (Global Sum) for vehicle no SIC 1198Y that was damaged pursuant to the accident

which occurred on 22/12/2020 (date) along Kallang Pudding Road (location) involving vehicle
no/s SJU 81317Z.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 29/12/2020 (date) at “the workshop”.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner GOO HONG TEE (“the third party
claimant”) of vehicle no SJC 1198Y make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/I deem fit. We/I enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage to SJC 1198Y (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a

without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.
Dated this ___ I (day) of /‘1535; (month) 2021 (year)

@ QY Oﬁ}L

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the workshop” (with chop)




ASIA MOTORSPORTS SOLUTION PTELTD
Spestalise In sales of new & reconditioned bikes
m'g.m;mm

GOO HONG TEE INVOICE NO: 2017/C293
DATE: 29/01/2021
VEHICLE NO: SJC 1198 Y
MAKE : TOYOTA ENGINE NO : 1AZE076376
MODEL : CAMRY 2.0 AUTO CHASSIS NO : MR053BK4107022045
ABS AIRBAG :
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT

Total lump sum repair including supply of parts and labour

Adjusted total lump sum repair costs

Total amount payable

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd

$$6,900.00

S$%6,900.00



Land Transport Authority

Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 24 Dec 2020/ 11:56:15
Receipt Date/Time : 24 Dec 2020/ 11:56:14
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-201224-001480
Previous Receipt No. :
S/N Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (S$) (S%$) (S%$)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SJU8131Z
As at 22 Dec 2020/12:03:00
Insurance Co: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
1 Insurance Enquiry - SJU8131Z
Enquiry Fee 7.00 0.49 7.49
20201224115507683793
Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable 7.45
Paid By
20201224115527147 Direct Debit: eNET_S Debit 745
(Internet Banking)
Total 7.45
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 7.45
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.



Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 12 March 2021 9:09 AM

To: kaizhupl@gmail.com

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJU 8131Z AND SJC 1198Y ON 22/12/2020

Our Ref: CC4/A1G20014648/Uba3

12 MARCH 2021

CHUA KHOON SENG

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJU 8131Z AND SJC 1198Y ON 22/12/2020

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



5/17/2021 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*$3C1198Y (0769198775SG)
[SIUS131Z]
TP

GOO HONG TEE
Dec 22 2020 11:00AM
[CHUA KHOON SENG]
Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd

| Reply || Reply All || Mark as Unread || Print Message || Delete Message || Forward |

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 21/04/2021 11:29 AM.
To LKK_HQ

Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$7867.45) - SJIC1198Y - Claim Handler: Lee, Ming-Yao

Approved:7867.45:to offer from low

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&iinboxid=1834298&iDomainld=11&iObjld=10684...  1/2



https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCobj&fuseaction=dsp_objlink&domainid=1&objid=979108&extid=352338&CFID=84527949&CFTOKEN=2c308b0950d452e7-ADB44951-9C9B-F51B-4A4DEECADA00F302&USID=10684&RID=1084990
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=84527949&CFTOKEN=2c308b0950d452e7-ADB44951-9C9B-F51B-4A4DEECADA00F302&USID=10684&RID=1084990
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=84527949&CFTOKEN=2c308b0950d452e7-ADB44951-9C9B-F51B-4A4DEECADA00F302&USID=10684&RID=1084990
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=84527949&CFTOKEN=2c308b0950d452e7-ADB44951-9C9B-F51B-4A4DEECADA00F302&USID=10684&RID=1084990
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=84527949&CFTOKEN=2c308b0950d452e7-ADB44951-9C9B-F51B-4A4DEECADA00F302&USID=10684&RID=1084990&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DSVCmail%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_view%26mode%3D1%26iinboxid%3D1834298%26iDomainId%3D11%26iObjId%3D10684%26iRecipientAliasId%3D12%26cur_ialiasid%3D12%26cur_vaalias%3DLKK_HQ%26assocdomain%3D1%26assocobj%3D979108%26assocobj2%3D352338%26urlback%3D%252Fclaims%252Findex%252Ecfm%253Ffusebox%253DMTRadjuster%2526fuseaction%253Ddsp%255Fclmheader%2526caseid%253D979108%2526extid%253D352338%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=84527949&CFTOKEN=2c308b0950d452e7-ADB44951-9C9B-F51B-4A4DEECADA00F302&USID=10684&RID=1084990
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