Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 28 December 2020 4:40 PM

To: 'SUR’; Nivitha (LKK Auto)

Cc: ‘assignments’; Stanley Lai

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10008492/ST || OI-SLW687E (Red) TP-SLB844D || Est: NIL ||
Zoom Autowerkz

Attachments: image006.jpg; CamScanner 12-28-2020 13.21.pdf

Dear LKK Team,

TP Survey for SMP1566P please.
Workshop details as below.

Ol GIA report not uploaded yet.

Regards,

Stanley Lai
Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2189
F +65 6725 0853
E stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg

It pays to choose Eaiki

Bugget "
irect ..
Insurance

Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

239924

budgetdirect.com.sg

auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

From: Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 28 December 2020 3:42 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Stanley Lai <stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg>



Subject: Re: Pre-Repair Inspection for SLB 844 D // Accident on 26/12/2020 @ 17:50HR at along Junction of Cross
Street & Robinson Road involving SLB 844 D & SLW 687 E | | Claim: C10008492

Dear All,
Kindly arrange Marcus Chua from LKK.

On Mon, Dec 28, 2020, 14:59 Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs,

Please find the list of our proposed surveyors.

Mr. William Ng (A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd)

Mr. Xing Guo Qiang (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd)

Mr. Mohammed Rasul (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd)

Mr. Mohamad Taufihk (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd)

Mr. Adrian Ling (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd)

Mr. Marcus Chua (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd)

Mr. Kenneth Kong (LKK Auto Consultant Pte Ltd)

Mr. Pang Kiah Keen (Frankie) (FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd)
Mr. Chua Soo Teck (Benjamin) (FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd)
Mr. Ng You Han (FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd)

Mr. Soon HanXin (Gary) (FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd)

Mr. Chow Bo Xiong (FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd)

Mr. Derrick Quok — our in house surveyor

Mr. Kenneth Lim — our in house surveyor

Kindly let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors.



Regards,

Stanley Lai

Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2189
F +65 6725 0853

E stanley.lai@budgetdirect.com.sg

Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199

Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre

Singapore
239924

budgetdirect.com.sg

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.



From: Zoom Autowerks <zoomautowerks@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 28 December 2020 1:43 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Pre-Repair Inspection for SLB 844 D // Accident on 26/12/2020 @ 17:50HR at along Junction of Cross
Street & Robinson Road involving SLB 844 D & SLW 687 E

Dear Sir/Madam,

We are instructed by Love4picnic and Glamping Associate to notify you of a road traffic accident on 26/12
/2020

at about 17:50HR along Junction of Cross Street & Robinson Road involving our client's vehicle registration
number SLB 844 D and vehicle registration number SLW 687 E driven by your insured at the material time.

A copy of the Singapore Accident Statement/Traffic Police Report filed is enclosed. As a result of the
accident, our client's vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceeds to repair the damaged vehicle,
please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you would like to conduct
a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated time, our
client shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further reference to you.

Please contact me @ 9450 7920, should you require more information.

Kindly arrange survey at Blk 15 Kaki Bukit Road 4, Bartley Biz Centre, #01-53, Singapore 4178

08.

Warmest Regards,

Elin Cai

Zoom Autowerks Pte Ltd
130 Bedok Reservoir Road
#08-1339 Singapore 470130

9450 7920



“Bzoomautowerks@gmail.com

- Please note our change in mailing/registered address with effect from 1st July
2018 -

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited,
Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee.
The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not
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