Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 28 December 2020 2:35 PM

To: jobi.thomas@eurokars.com.sg; eva.kok@eurokars.com.sg;
eric.glorioso@eurokars.com.sg; assignments

Cc: Jenny Lew; Claims Dept of CTI; Alfred Toh

Subject: SNM20D205060/C02/SKX5287A/LEWLC / OUR REF : SKX5287A / OUR REF : SBF7B
THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Attachments: 1335_001.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

YOUR REF: SBF7B
OUR REF: SNM20D205060/C02/SKX5287A/LEWLC

Dear Sirs
We refer to your email of even date pertaining to the above matter.

Liability is clear and we agree to go for Direct Settlement, subject to consistency of damages, based on findings from M/s LKK
Auto Consultants Pte Ltd., with supporting documents.

Aside to M/s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd., please assist to arrange survey on SBF7B.

Merimen folder shall be created shortly and/or soonest possible.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as
delay is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh
Senior Executive
Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

alfred.toh@sq.cntaiping.com
W: www.sqg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: X3EJifiif; TaipingSG
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may
contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please
delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Claims Dept of CTI

Sent: Monday, December 28, 2020 1:47 PM

To: Jobi Thomas <jobi.thomas@eurokars.com.sg>; Eva Kok <eva.kok@eurokars.com.sg>; Eric Paul Glorioso
<eric.glorioso@eurokars.com.sg>; Jenny Lew <jenny.lew@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: O/R: SNM20D205060/C02/SKX5287A/LEWLC / FW: YOUR REF : SKX5287A / OUR REF : SBF7B THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Dear Alfred,



Please conduct PRS for SBF7B.

Note: officer in charge — Jenny Lew

*** Kindly quote our reference number when replying.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be expected
for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224
7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thank you

Chong Boon Sen

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: (65) 63896116 | F: (65) 62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: X Jfif Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential
information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you
are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.



From: Jobi Thomas <jobi.thomas@eurokars.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 24 December 2020 1:59 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Eva Kok <eva.kok@eurokars.com.sg>; Eric Paul Glorioso <eric.glorioso@eurokars.com.sg>
Subject: YOUR REF : SKX5287A / OUR REF : SBF7B THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Kindly arrange the survey of our client’s vehicle ASAP at 27A Tanjong Penjuru.
Attached is the ESTIMATE & ACCIDENT REPORT for your perusal.

We would appreciate it if you can kindly let us know the liability/status of this case.

Best Regards.

AYS

Jobi Thomas

Senior Insurance Claims Executive

27A Tanjong Penjuru, Singapore 609042

T: (65) 6331 0680 D: (65) 6331 0682 F: (65) 6331 0690

E: jobi.thomas@eurokars.com.sg W: www.eurokarsgroup.com




