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[MANDATE GIVEN - EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] RE: LOD Submission of TPDS -
Accident Involving SMT8461R and SHC3508Y on 18.12.2020 - D20005215MFSH

Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Fri 5/14/2021 3:06 PM

To:  Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Dear Jaslin,
 
We refer to your below email.
 
You have our mandate to se�le the ma�er from $13,085.00 - $13,141.00 (all in).
 
Please start to offer LOR @ $100 x 8 Days w/o GST first.
 
Thank you.
 
Kind Regards,
 
Vic Sanghilan
Motor Claim Department
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877
| Tel: 65073848 | DID : 65073846 |  Fax No. : 65073849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg | Company Regn. No.
195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group
 
Personal Data Protec�on Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
h�p://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collec�on Statement.
 
Confiden�ality No�ce: This e-mail is confiden�al. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error,
please delete the message and all copies from your system and no�fy the sender immediately by return e-mail.
 
From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 4 May 2021 5:12 pm 
To: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] RE: LOD Submission of TPDS - Accident Involving SMT8461R and
SHC3508Y on 18.12.2020 - D20005215MFSH
 
Dear	Sirs/Mdm,
	
ACCIDENT	INVOLVING	SHC3508Y	(FCI)	AND	SMT8461R	(TP)	ON	18.12.2020
	
We	refer	to	the	above	matter.
	
We	seek	your	approval	to	offer	repairer	“KAH	MOTOR	CO	SDN	BERHAD"	at	$	13,141.00	(all-in).
	
The	summary	is	as	follows:	-
 

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1.	Cost	of	Repair $	16,048.55 $	12,285.00	($11,481.32	+	7%	GST)
2.	Loss	of	Rental	(8	days	x	$107.00) $	856.00 $	856.00	(8	days	x	$107.00)

mailto:vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg
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5/24/2021 Mail - Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/id/AAQkAGY5MjA5NjAxLWUzOTktNDAzMi1hNmYyLWQzMjg1MjhjYjA2OQAQABW6GcNiRUviu5ka2GDkNDM%3D 2/4

Total $	16,904.55 $	13,141.00
	
Surveyor	recommended	8	days	for	repair.
	
Enclosed	here	with	all	the	relevant	documents	for	your	perusal.
	
Kindly	let	us	have	your	approval	/	instruction.
	
	
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

	
From: Vic Alpeh S. Sanghilan <VicSanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 30 April 2021 3:35 PM 
To: Desmond Toh <desmondtoh@honda.com.sg>; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Winson Chow <winsonchow@honda.com.sg>; Jerome Tan <jerometan@honda.com.sg>; Leon Lim
<leonlim@honda.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [EXPRESS SETTLEMENT via LKK] RE: LOD Submission of TPDS - Accident Involving SMT8461R and SHC3508Y on
18.12.2020 - D20005215MFSH
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
 
Your Ref:  SMT8461R
MSFCIL Ref  :  D20005215MFSH
LKK REF: CC4/FCI20014470/ra3
 
Dear Desmond,
 
Accident involving SHC3508Y & SMT8461R on 18.12.2020.
 
We acknowledge receipt of your le�er of claim dated 30.04.2021.
 
Please be informed that this ma�er is handled by LKK our our behalf and they will get back to you for an update/offer in
due course.
 
Thank you.
 
 
Dear Jaslin,
 
FYNA please.
 
Thank you.
 
Kind Regards,
 
Vic Sanghilan
Motor Claim Department
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877
| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3846 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: vicsanghilan@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn.
No. 195000106C
A Member of  Insurance Group
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Personal Data Protec�on Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
h�p://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collec�on Statement.
 
Confiden�ality No�ce: This e-mail is confiden�al. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error,
please delete the message and all copies from your system and no�fy the sender immediately by return e-mail.
 
 
 
From: Desmond Toh <desmondtoh@honda.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 30 April 2021 2:23 pm 
To: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Winson Chow <winsonchow@honda.com.sg>; Jerome Tan <jerometan@honda.com.sg>; Leon Lim
<leonlim@honda.com.sg> 
Subject: FW: LOD Submission of TPDS - Accident Involving SMT8461R and SHC3508Y on 18.12.2020 - D20005215MFSH
 
Your Ref: SHC3508Y - D20005215MFSH
 
Our Ref: SMT8461R
 
 
M/s:    First Capital Insurance Ltd
              36 Robinson Road                      
              #16-01 City House                     
              Singapore 068877                      
A�n:     Motor Claims Department
                            
 
Dear All,
 
Above is the a�ached document for third party direct se�lement claim.
 
Kindly provide us your finalized se�lement & payment as your soonest .
 
We’ll appreciate if you could reply to us once receive this email
 
 
Best Regards,
 
Desmond Toh
Contact No: 6514 5848
Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd.
8 Mandai Estate Singapore 729905
 
 
From: Printer Service <printservice@honda.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 30 April 2021 2:04 pm 
To: Desmond Toh <desmondtoh@honda.com.sg> 
Subject: A�ached Image
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Con�idential	Note:	The	information	contained	in	this	email	is	intended	only	for	the	use	of	the
individual	or	entity	named	above	and	may	contain	information	that	is	privileged,	con�idential
and	exempt	from	disclosure	under	applicable	law.	If	the	reader	of	this	message	is	not	the
intended	recipient,	you	are	hereby	noti�ied	that	any	dissemination,	distribution	or	copying	of
this	communication	is	strictly	prohibited.	If	you	have	received	this	message	in	error,	please
immediately	notify	the	sender	and	delete	the	mail.	Thank	you.

http://www.hondajazz.sg/
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