Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 February 2021 6:52 PM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: China Taiping // Our ref - SBL91A Your ref: SNM20D204993 // DOA:
18/12/2020 MAZDA TOWED // TP // FCOR

Attachments: 4599_001.pdf; China Taiping SBL91A CX3 -FCORxIsx.pdf; IMG_8876.jpg; IMG_

8870.jpg; IMG_8871.jpg; IMG_8872.jpg; IMG_8874.jpg; IMG_8875.jpg

From: Jen Lim

Sent: Wednesday, 3 February 2021 6:51:57 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Jess Francis Carlos; Eva Kok; Jobi Thomas; Eric Paul Glorioso; Ronald Yap; Stephanie Loke; Yvonne Chew;
Jessica Harry Shastri; Tommy Woon Wui Tew; Jason Wong; Admin A

Subject: RE: China Taiping // Our ref - SBL91A Your ref: SNM20D204993 // DOA: 18/12/2020 MAZDA TOWED // TP
// FCOR

Dear Rasul,

Our COR computation is attached for your agreement.
COR: $22,225.30 before GST
9 repair days (not including preparation of estimate, wait for survey/authorization/spare parts, Sat/Sun/PH)

Kindly confirm the above as soon as possible

Regards,

JEN LIM

Insurance Claims Admin
27A, Tanjong Penjuru
Singapore 609042

(® ELROKARS SERVICES

From: Jason Wong <jason.wong@eurokars.com.sg>

Sent: 22 December 2020 7:11 PM

To: Jess Francis Carlos <jess.carlos@eurokars.com.sg>

Cc: Eva Kok <eva.kok@eurokars.com.sg>; Jobi Thomas <jobi.thomas@eurokars.com.sg>; Eric Paul Glorioso
<eric.glorioso@eurokars.com.sg>; Ronald Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg>; Stephanie Loke
<stephanie.loke@eurokars.com.sg>; Yvonne Chew <yvonne.chew@eurokars.com.sg>; Randell Goon
<randell.goon@eurokars.com.sg>; Jen Lim <jen.lim@eurokars.com.sg>; Jessica Harry Shastri
<jessica.shastri@eurokars.com.sg>; Catherine Chua <catherine.chua@eurokars.com.sg>; Tommy Woon Wui Tew
<tommy.woon@eurokars.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Est TP China Taiping // Our ref - SBL91A // 24865

Dear Jess,

Estimate as Attached,



Thank you.
Best Regards.

() ELROKARS
jasonWong

Parts Advisor
EUROKARS SERVICES
27A Tanjong Perjuru
Singapore 609042
DID : (+65) 63310696

From: Jess Francis Carlos <jess.carlos@eurokars.com.sg>

Sent: 21 December 2020 1:25 PM

To: Jason Wong <jason.wong@eurokars.com.sg>

Cc: Ronald Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg>; Yvonne Chew <yvonne.chew@eurokars.com.sg>
Subject: Est TP China Taiping // Our ref - SBL91A // 24865

Dear Jason,

Kindly prepare the estimate for this case.
The car is inside our workshop now.
Regards.

Jess Francis Carlos
Insurance Claims Executive
Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd

27A Tanjong Penjuru
Singapore 609042

Tel no.: 8128 9802

This email, including any attachment, is intended for the sole use of the recipient(s) named above and may contain
information that is confidential and/or proprietary to the Eurokars Group. If you have received it in error, please
notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system. Please do not copy it or use it
for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.



