Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 24 December 2020 10:22 AM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Market Value SJK8785P || C10008427
Attachments: Used Honda Stream Cars _ Singapore Car Prices & Listing - sgCarMart.pdf
Hi Shiau Chan,

MYV = $20,000.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Oi Sun Pini Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, December 23, 2020 12:26 PM
To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Market Value SJK8785P Il C10008427
Importance: High

Dear Sun Pin,
Kindly assist to quote the range of MV...thanks...

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Loganathan Agoram <loganathan.a@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 23 December 2020 10:46 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
<siewsc @lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Market Value SJK8785P Il C10008427

Importance: High

Hi Team,



Can I get the MV for vehicle STK8785P.

DOA: 20/12/2020

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle TS
Vehicle Owner Particulars Clooo@427 /LA
Owmer ID Type: Singapore NRIC PoA: 2o.12 12020
Owner ID; 918H
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: SJKBT783P
Vehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Deregistration Date: 22 Dec 2020
Vehicle Make: HOMDA
Vehicle Model: STREAM 1.BX A
Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacturing Year: 2008
Engine No.: R1BA1792224
Chassis Mo.: RM&1083151
Maximum Power Output: 103.0 kW (138 bhp)
Open Market Value: $16,847.00
Original Registration Date: 07 Nov 2008
First Registration Date: 07 Nov 2008
Transfer Count: 2
Actual ARF Paid: $16,847.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: Forfeited
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 06 Mov 2023
COE Category: B - Car (1601cc & above)
COE Period(Years): 5
PQP Paid: £16,061.00
COE Rebate Amount: £9,232.00
Total Rebate Amount: £9,232.00
Message

Thank you

Logan

Executive, Claims
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auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services
Pte. Limited, Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the
intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated
author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It
may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived
and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended
addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant
that this email is error or virus free.



